APA-1

07/04
TRANSMITTAL SHEET FOR
NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION
Control No. Department or Agency _Alabama Department of Economic and Community Affairs

Rule No. _305-2-4-.09
Rule Title: _Residential Building Code
_ XX New Amend _ XX Repeal Adopt by Reference

Would the absence of the proposed rule significantly
harm or endanger the public health, welfare, or safety? NO

Is there a reasonable relationship between the
state’s police power and the protection of the
public health, safety, or welfare? NO

Is there another, less restrictive method of
regulation available that could adequately protect
the public? NO

Does the proposed rule have the effect of directly
or indirectly increasing the, costs of any goods or
services involved and, if so, to what degree? NO

Is the increase in cost, if any, more harmful to the
public than the harm that might result from the ,
absence of the proposed rule? NO

Are all facets of the rulemaking process designed
solely for the purpose of, and so they have, as
their primary effect, the protection of the public? YES

***************************************************************************

Does the proposed rule have an economic impact? _NO

If the proposed rule has an economic impact, the proposed rule is required to be accompanied by a fiscal
note prepared in accordance with subsection (f) of Section 41-22-23, Code of Alabama 1975.

*************************************************************************
Certification of Authorized Official
I certify that the attached proposed rule has been proposed in full compliance with the requirements of

Chapter 22, Title 41, Code of Alabama 1975, and that it conforms to all applicable filing requirements of
the Administrative Procedure Divisig ive i

'. 1

Signature of certifying officq

Date ’7 Z! [%)
J (

(DATE FILED)
(STAMP)




APA-2
07/04

ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC AND COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
ALABAMA ENERGY AND RESIDENTIAL CODES BOARD

NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION

RULE NO. & TITLE:
305-2-4-.09 “Residential Building Code”

INTENDED ACTION: Repeal and Replace

SUBSTANCE OF PROPOSED ACTION: The Alabama Energy and Residential Codes
Board, under the Alabama Department of Economic and Community Affairs, proposes to repeal
rule 305-2-4 -.09, “Residential Building and Energy Code”, and to replace it with the provisions
of the most recently adopted Alabama Residential Building Code,

TIME, PLACE, MANNER OF PRESENTING VIEWS:
A session for oral comment will be held on Wednesday, August 26, 2015 from 10:00 am until
11:00 am, at the Alabama Center for Commerce, 401 Adams Avenue, Room 342, 36104,

All interested parties may present their views in writing to Heather Goggin, ADECA Energy
Division, P.O. Box 5690, Montgomery, AL 36103-5690. All comments must be received by the
end of business on Friday, September 4, 2015. :

FINAL DATE FOR COMMENT AND COMPLETION OF NOTICE:
September 4, 2015

CONTACT PERSON AT AGENCY:

Heather Goggin, ADECA Energy Division

401 Adams Avenue, Suite 560

Montgomery, AL 36104

(334) 242-5330 - Codes.Board@adeca.alabama.gov

Alabama Department of Economic and
Community Affairs, General Counsel



L% Y

|

WSS I = A=
[S TR v o o s vk & A et

T Dy

(e ]
SOTT

Poaod et f -~

ooy

]
4

Tt ey —

2000

XN Fi

L IS T T T

[ B iy
+- 1
Ly

[LE ¢ i W) W iyl ot o iy wry

Pl ~

8 S g e TS

Aol —Rrogesr (o meanar E IR . P PN
R 3 TR AT SR g e e

.
o

LLELW
LR ) S W i oy w5 o e

£ Tt

L)

£3 e o

o
wWotr—

gy
gy e e F
[ RS

4= e s
[y ey g i g

ol Bl

.I_lll\.;J_‘j.y
£

LT
pan

[N v 5 i e
LN N AP i\
F)

1y ]
& i o g

e
L LI i

131
T Cas

L enree oy vy
LTINS TTT

r L= =L=F ¥

cade oo ]

Pl

I _..0e2
G | LTS L

PSS

110

£l QMMM T

LU S v

L RN T N ERE ]
(= R e iy = i e o

'
2

+

[ Rl e Py L W 2y

T g 3

iy W ek e s
Farrmln

A _F

WSt S
ooy

EoN IR TSN N IR Py

et e b o 3

=l

AL R v A

L 3% N i P

PO crrn oy
(= aw oy
Aot o

£

17

Evy

tl.,L. LJ.J.I.UJ.LLJ.\B'

AT OTT

LT

LT

ASWITTTO OO ED

R s [ L

Iy gnrn 4 A

le/J_ll.L_L [y vy

£+
LS i ey

4o gy
AN A R A

N N PPN
VST OO LI
LN N I =
LTS

srorm e e
L= RN

3 o o
RS v sy ey ) T

£330 e

1

L Ny e g iy \.a\.il_l.-l-kll\l.\.ailb,

]
1]

b B

TICASTITC

P= R N SN

L g

A o ey
g g 1

P RN LY

LY LN

CESEE S BEV.9N
[
PR

al =11 o~
ST T o
srd v o]

Al o e ey

= SN |
[} L Y= o= P i g g ey i e

R 3 X~ |

LinSNEN
T

AT oy
L4 e e =y

o

[ o s

=
TSI
S N oY

i S E o uAtJUDLAJ_\.a

i
CTTOTES

omzds o o 8 s an
AT T OT

+

(_I.\jb-l-—l-J.J.IJ =

I SWENENE S SN A
(SR A ey § 3y ¥ A=

ey o

L=t

p AN I

PoNE S O Y

R =

o v o]

T
NN I N SN
THITCE

T I e
L S N A R by A PR I O A SR L s

F g it g ey

o i1

AN vy i

R
LIS [ T N NI WOl RN N WY & 2

|

oo =

LI i Ao S wr iy
kSIS
JE R ATy g o e g e

LE RS ENEVAPRSE I~ D
" S A A i o 3 e
Qa1 ]

LS 3 ey

1 =
Wt

1

24
[ 4

N SN =
W oI e e eES

1.7

o e g m] o g ey
(35Tl g £ i i e e

1o

2
L IL

1y o

I |
A
Loy an o

[n gt o ew e g

q oo o

3 3

15
[

be 3
[0 3 i5 = e g s 4

P N |

EA ot oo
LT T Ry e e s e

CA SO ISV SV R |
p e TS P NS NI M S N NSTY o A iy

LR Nl A 1L W S o R e e ]

412
T

3

LallJ_ULA\jll.

Teaerdan

3

-

O I IR
¥ S O N Wiy 4 i P S o

A

PR T I S W= S |

le]mg

[ =g g i 3 e o s
inisKeTAW,)

£y e o g

T PN SR B = RPNy
oottt a— S

L I

Jm

EERER T

L2N
p

[ 0 N ) o iy i Y

l_}__y LTS

MNTTDR

[ 9L 0 VLN § § £ Ry B s vy

= 120
WL LT

[ I v e [ ey

£ =0 SN o PSP SO RPENTN
[ A=h~pvm oy i §

Ly vy o §

(R X

Sttt o] o e oy
[ A i v G e

ey

N
LT

Ol o
LA ey

Y EELE

PESPe B L

1

LY
T s

Hont 2

LRy gu s o

BEEEasrat Josr ble e N o oo s T e o
G oarT L ¥ AT . iy e = R0

L= LY
= A=E T

ho_»mease g 44 -
N -y bl\..- [ 47 B Dt by W e W

LEY XA = A By

Y

O o
L~ e

M e
[SA= I S A FAT AR RS N T

3101

Y

VS

=

ol £
T iy

CAP-N N TP EN
JA=T S
=N

ETCES 2

3

ST S L Do M e WLl i

Aot e

TP S |
[y g —y LR LN N e N LY o i

E=N Y

¥ e o
O —XIt
a1 1

=

=R )

+

IS e )y e 5
eyt o s

EEW-NEVLENE I S S|
ey

sz, ~f

-

'
2
L SR S st e my gy

1

PEPENERY SO A - RPN Sy meE v an 1o ISR SCETS T SR S AT P
L=F ¥ 3wy A [ S WP M Bigie gy wry g iy g ey [ O e S g LI LA " w LWE I g L T WP by Y IR LR A Ay
1 alemal
T T

oo

ISR
L - i

L3
WAL

1ol
I 4 e

e

o C oy e

A1
[ T S L WL e e

Llemmnmrn oy
(=TI ST Sy )

A ook oy
L, = e =) L-VJ—..}’

4=

AT R R ey vy

SL gm0

+ln
[ Sy

3
g =

3

b2 7
tntCc—oar 1 GCE

+h

Fompel sy
\JULLLL_'J—k—b\-\A u_y

el

Ty
[ 7. i P e

FETEE YW I P PR B |
| N S S M P ERLNPY 5t Ry gy
M}

(i
LI

£3

Y A1 e ]
ESR e s 4 T i my = 1 5 S

EEN s R

1ot 4=

[ M v g vy

o SN
[ § 3. o

A
ERE-F ey

i g v s gt g ) i e

ot

oo anm e T o e 3 e o ]
| LTI A e v v s

K]

Fomanmed ol e

L ¥

LTI

o e

e R e A =

L an £

[SEil S =y A g Py

DR |

WTETD

9 3

1

Jo ey o
OOt

n

4
[

E RPN N e |
P e g v e e G
R T |

ISP R T T B e SN
JUJE S H W R ) A= [N U A e A S R B s g

gzl ao

¥

maso el o o T
LJJ-¢ O LTI O

EEY
!

£1.o
TnOoE

[ =L e o

R
Eonnot g

Ayl oy o s
ETOW o et

L= o= s

Joy o e oy
FV e 3§ Ay o

fo] Al
L= ey = 2

13ped = 0 o
oIt OtT

£

WTLEIoF

PO i )

= 3 ]
(=% ¥

1

rrontottatt Oty

B2

P
[ N

ot ane
k=) L ANCTTIT

1

3

TPaccS?

CEymy. o o

Cipyameld B o )
LA ¥ QW sy e my W ey g

11t da

L e Al L™ R W g 5 ny ey e o W iy

S B L T S

o
L
13 ot 41~

[ P -y

+ Y

Elheogn
L 5 S

Tl e
W e
P N . |

LYY

R
LI I LN P i o6 ke s e Y

ot £
O

[alsralal)
D=2 T A=A

s

. .
D e S R = I
LTI [ LW i o i iy TIN T ‘:’u_LJ.J. [T ) e WA N NN ey W ap N

L I ey

v o
et B E o
L™ ¥ S LTS S WP i i, w5 2 Y W LITL LT

=

N

FaFal ik afat oot
AL A B R vy

=l
ol

£
= S

EETNE TN
L e 3= = sy

£
L P A

('
CIITIT

maroe Fh
T

14 c

[ == =y oy

P e |

Tk

=

o

1 s o e

R B LS
ot s
\v

+ 1 o

CEATZLN g am e

o

ELX EILN
SYPeS

L= ¥ et

[ L g g by

Clmsnd 3 3 e o
[T N S W S B g ey o gy e ey

T

L= g L wy v

[y ¥ s

R e = i AL |

EEE N R

vt
=y ]

e

o 3
ooy

R I 2 Y
LU= v

Lol e T

e
L 2 e b pn 1wy w g

o

'
Sy g

1
A ey 1

o VoY

ey o
o ey

'
sl

P
LT iy

n

o

=

o

re
=8 3 S S S mp ot i



g o
L O oo

Jord s ~
S o e ey e g g

el e meaoant o

rveirroaT Dotir-nea te 7
il l Al
TIiroto e

5L

EN T W I i IR |
s e

P ymort NPT ACNNE Y
T pmnc o wne Ee——0mt
ardlor ool

P Y

1 o~
= 3~

o e d A oy
LR ¥ L ey J—\JuJ—u\—lll\ﬂ\-"

L

2
[ S i

ot
= )

v

LT CST

P2 ISP RO RPN Sy

|
L= S T W N By

LIS s L v e

(=% ¥ Ay A

W g et o
LS S Aol ey s s ny )

SN SN
J.J.\auh\_-d.,

e
THOROHT

an

LN |
L2 3 vy 3 o v

1304

EEE N |

=
[ E R v

Mo oy
T

A e ol 14,04
TN N WP E Wl m ey o Ay g WLIATALLAT L LNoC
ALY SN

'
i)

et

o1 e ey

££
\JJ.J.J.DJ-UJ.J-\J)’

Dy

ot
Fap .y

L T S e e e o ey

'
Sy e yn

W]
Ty

r

e ot o
rreoet T

g
£agea

loctan
LSRN By S e

Syl

2y
LA Y Ry ey

24 .
|l

+

I ey ey AT

LT TITGs

fy g anam oo
alk~17

1l opidand ~
LI BE N N WP v vy ey

oo oy

Herent e s meman s A o
REYE S g SRS S N S g G o i A T

\jus
A= R Y

o
Iho o

P -

1
1

[ e My ey e e e i e i

1
|

=

[ ip 3 = gm rgve g

o ]
[ R ok gy e g ey

L T LR W e o i a7

o ge d o
T CTE TS

Py
LT

EERN g my B &y )

Fa e o

ool
L= oy > ) e

= o
=y ELws

q oo

S
L%\ oy e ey )

o
Vgt

Ch g oy ey g
B e g

=

LEPSSEN

LEE S WPSRrp EiE
=T R A o e s e e 5

PN = SN P
LA * Sy i

ESET I U SU T N

PO L
[y

S = Ry

TN
o a1 ]

=

. 3
el ddea man
NI L iy e v i R

=1

1

1esr

el o o
(=~ S = s my W

= IR I Iy |
AL 5 A S 5 o = -

3 v
SEEEPP

oo an

oL

=

[0 0 e mp e

ca

[S) A= sty )

Fa kot W]

LA TN I TP
LT %3]

K

1ol o4
[ E T T gy gy

Iy

Txa
Lo oWy

£l

Ly

WL CTT

St o o] Mo
Lo L i g = v 3 )

| e P, NS £ . 11-0 .20
LI ey ) W M s P v B s

A4

Tt o e
T

—

{SIENETSY
TV ot

] _Aeoane ola ] ]
LA e R . e e

o1y
LT SR ey e

S gt

=
LIE S EaT pea)

ET S o oy

¥

A
uhy .ﬁm
D .nuq
s
b D
H H
[} .
1] ]
[
jus
P
a
i D
23]
#ow
-H D
L9 i3]
s} 1
= iy}
3 [
QO
]
1
b i
@ s
& &
-H
—H ®
il ﬁM
P i5
A
[ 4] (3}
[4)] M
3] b
(03] B
b A
D
b
il
L {3}
~H KeH
[)] 1]
A&
[e3]
3] 4
~H . -rH
4P I
1B 1
H 1]
1))
¢ I YR
~. k3
0 . 2]
D P
A
<)) (ot
e -
P
= o jak}
LL o

fT C g o S ey

R
PN TN, B

g

CEYm et E Sy Y L Y
BN ¥ Ay S 3 ot

- A~
L wy T o k/bJ—\J\JJlL— L

FA-1- TR

L0 0 g e w A

-
L=

T T T e/

=l

TIv

TIT oIt

Tt

e LT PR S R e N
| E A R A= 1L o AT i

ER S, B
L Ny o ey oy

PESL IR IOy
KT = 2 S Ay

—~ 11

L L= e

]
L% A SR S )

Aed  +
| = TR Ty

4 o

P SN s N SN S o |
[o 9 1 g g sty o b

Ao e e
TS COT

1 gk

PO L Y

\.J\il_l._L L= N N M sy B

=i eV

PV S PN
LW N g y [ S 7 3 1) Ay b p g

Xor

D
iX

=t

1
LILo T

LW ER |
IS

£ A

\_’Ull.lh-‘,l,. CI_JL.)_LJ.J.\j

Lo
o £

P2
R

1
LT

NN
T oChot

b
VI TISTT

FSN

ety o] - A
oy oty

o 1~y
(R o A

SR
g, [ P B =y

SR I I

~
[N A Lp(.A..L_LM’\_l.,

£
= e

ok o S s 2
J ML NUTRY Wy aiv R Sy 0 I e

Pt ]
A

L & R Eips My my

4 L EL NP NN S T Y
COT R Ve e

]
L]
el By

Tl g )

3
WIT 1T

£

SN T R oy e ey
k}LA..I_rJUL)\.a L

d= I o
L ey

=¥y

b I U
[ I N N ) U R By 7 O R B wr i i o

LW KR

Wy
()
D
LN
R
\]
) @
O =
s8]
Q40
0@
Q
L p R m
T @
i
-]
- Q
o
(8]
AL
+ D
o
D -
4 B
£ o
-H
(o]
m
¢ ©
- 40
—
iy
-H @
Dy
1]
N
£ T
¢ q
oo
4o
@,
C @
O
l—..l_ HU
b -
iy
A 0
B
n Q
oo
- U
o
[l
w D
=H -
Yd 4
K
D o3
1!
D @
{1
R

.
1 Lo

T
[ S A ey S S I % e S Ay

L oLk ]

[ St M

ae £317
LS A iy ey PY L LN

PN SN S B
(S i

PR T ISR T - WP, SN
P I Ay ey 4% R S ey W o T VOO

CEREa

1 1
L A iy ey

ot 4
I 1T \_-(.rI..LLJ._I..I.J.LJ

fraa Ve T

| 207172
Oy Ty = oS

T11] =z

15T

L e g g - W g e

TE L o
fompl 4o

PN N e D
™~

v

A T v qoe

L8 9 B ¥ g iy e 37

I EMENPE T NN SSPS S R
LTDo O TrT L Ly ey L=y

alanld
[ i 1= = e s e

=g =a = g v un

e LN

DO
IO

=
L= =

LT T I LS T T o2

AT T IO

3omcan] o
LENS OO oL LS L=

L,
e

Shatt

PN S Sy S,
L% SR W R .

]
2
T IT

e

Aot
AT RV Ly Sy v

o3 ] v g
TRy

N |
L= e g oy

e o ]

ESN SN S|
oo T Ot e

LW

oy
AT kdu&_ TIOoOTIL

Ao ey

Maz ot o
[S R A Wby )

Ty mimondt 4 e
LJ{}.\J\JHL.-.L\JJ.-I. L)

21

el
AR S

jorn o
L e o 4 (=

USETIE B I [ IR PR oY
SEELTEE S pr  qR S E o T

ESNZWEN

NIE T Y PI
Trho Tt

eomal-ats
Al e S T

1
LT L Ay
Ay

£ e e
RO ) SN

Argot PN 20 £ (10 ey
(52 % § & om mpe pw ) et Ty O OO

L ALy ey

A S LT
AT ST

E=N2Y
= ¥y

o
p

oryer

L P iyl vy

ESUN EEWF N Sy
L0 R e g s 1 1
- |

L S 4 R At (N i g s

E I N N P P ~ ST i A e gy n
|y T LIS ) B B i e ) pY [P R
ITYASWNECUENENE S O SR I e

AN SN O P
SO T

=

=il

'
4

AT b s o

Pl o o
IS

11

.
194 3
LJ-L-J-..L_LLALf\_L,

E LYY
[ )

L3 S m ey L.LLL.LLLBU

R SRy e e RN
[ I ) A S A X A Y

1]
P N Ay LW ¥ oy e ey vy

=1n

L=



]
7.3

+
wWia—CTt

S an ] S
LR Sl v ¥ g A

LY

2
i T A

=

EEP-W- RN
ER AN £ e iy

=N
ol S T M

exla~ 11

szln man ot SR
At ohs TG o

PN S % Y
L |5 i

1l eonctls
T

St

oo ok

£ o

Ixz mem oo o
COTs—O,

R

+

-l anbab el 7 7., o4 o

alha11

RLLL= T e ey

COe oy

=¥
PR |

Lo v ocr

e TS T TN S S A e gy G & g LTI

[ 1N L A

[ i o iy g ¢

3

R ke g
T 1.9 A

Ol ooiyne
L e e e ¥

Crxrende o
R S =1 e s

o] £117 3
[ LWy v i v
=0 SN |

3 oy RN
L LV iy e my
e

3021
Ty

I

eracle
Bu.u T

P BNy I TPy
u\.u.l.ul:.\.»u,

'
4

3.

2117
RS = R

copmr 1z el +h
\.a\..'l.l.l._t-‘.l._y L o =y
o O e N Y 4
[ L n Eyr . g

= o e

EAEEW-Y )
AT T

el oo
34—{_].!-)”

LEWe

L o

a_£3
-J_.I.g WA B M my
A
[ 40 L A i )y e

1Q3n 1o
LT

.
R

EICE IR SN Y
WCLL

=y ey g

15 e ]
EA A i
SN S S I |
T rtr

PR T K N

F o an
i

T

de o o
ey

.
a1 Tz

'
L
LT O STV O

o

Sy iy yoa s o

ECECNE R N oy
EEA R My S Sy

IS v 191 T
p A~ T

[N ¥ X & gl g

PEIESR Y
|4 g i &

1

SRR

A e oy

R T

CO SN TR P
[SJ=F ¥ e e mp i

£

o
2 S T it

2o

EE |
[ Ry y

ISELT-K WX oW
Y o T

A LN B terd
o7 ]
[N I 1 o sipm e g

—]

(== ye)

TO——1oTE
o PRSP P I = |
oo

ah 1]

T

mao e

3 1 ey wh

oL

T+ IIT
LT
191 2.0

[ XL

Pt )
GO Ty

IR Ay B
E ™ TP e v TS TR B Berg by oy w g )

T PN
1R

LY

[0 I 9" R g

ot
Lo R il iy

[F S N sy W g g vy
la1o

Floonra I oy

£
o e ey §

ERNE
Loul-lb g

+ 2wz
(== ¥ == o g g i

P N |

£ W =L L K - =G g |
T O P OESHTE

[N p iy i
£
£1 Y Wy il oy

1 oo T )
.21 g g e g

oy oy ]
o i g o el ey e o

R A e v e T i

T

I~

Cleymtn ey o o e e
A T T PR Ry e ey
PR M . NN

9 i W I N TN S SR
e
1

THCLo T oo

LT e

LNl
pi gy

Py

chand-eal.l
[ B & o g mpu my o J.LI.\_'\.JJ.J.(_I.J-L.J_.U(J._L:T.Y
senlad Meahandieal £-o
[=ET L% "= =g a [ &= g ap vrh wr L A T U i g L COoTOTD

L1 e e 2y [y ey
et mpymm s e A o o
AT LT U O AL N WP e )

Wy
T

£

o o e )
o ooty

=

Hril1la1o
oo

LI N oY
Wit

corars ] -
Rl y1a e

P |
T

EAEEWoT W
Py ey )

.
does o
L5 S R ey

Nnoenmadt ] ]
A 2 Ay v e e g g
1010

E =T I T |
p g e gy g o g

PP = Y

WICTTT

1353
Lo

£
i e

fo e

2 +

'
(ALK KILN

=217 e pao e les

[ § = = mpm oy

|

romemeot ol clen vt o sl -]
LR ¥ L S 1 Ay oy o e ey 3 e By e 4
ano— ka7l
TLTECE

T

]
= o
ST e

A= = = A

P4 Suwapnmg ) ol LUNILT e
o £
.A.(.rl.b) LY ey
o e oo

A

L= p e

e

e 3
LA 1130

NIPENENEE S SN P

[ T MY & gy

r L339

I

N S NP Ry i B ST I
LT O [ e .y [ S Y B WY N e
o F
L g i

1=
= T

LRSI A SE S A e

P oy

o
PR A e = L T LT Y =y

.

NPT

[ L oy w2y
4o o4 o]

(=3

LY
AT

(¥l
(Am=1

L pumn sy

F3 1 Sorigl oy o e e e

el
[=F ¥ 3w

Loy i s ey

o

2 P ]
518wy s vin e

T

Ty

g

L Y

maeckh o
IS ST

LEN s B

CEX 7o e e

L1119
L S v

RS
JOoTrCT

3t
oI

oy g ae s Al
(== =p = p v gy

=

TN
TETE OO
P SN |

oyl ] c g

Rk A= = = ag

[ W v )

.
S0 res

1]
cho ot o—oCaT

UJ [S-J b ey s )
1Akl 1

L gy oy [y

Sy ey ] o g
(ST i 1 = v e

L

R
P i

1

o
[ S ey g 4 i e L P W

1 EC

W 8 I It b s w4 oy

o PSS 1)
o TWO I

e o ]
o e

+

e F et o
L . L\ iy o ey ey )

Slenes
J_I\J(-LJ\LL‘:’\——

T

q 2002

T

i ==

=

=

R A b Su =y 3

PO CYY

L

= Lol

oo

[V ey

=r

Ly

et
AT | g

)

T frad

{26 ©

o oo e T P SR I ) [0 SRS ey
TTOIT e g = \—\iou_ L= Lr . Y

o
T

NN

= e B |
[ ¥ 3. 3 M e v 4

Ly o
S i a =

1

Iy el 4 4o s
A= ST AL g gt e e s
[ T

7 u.L.l.nT

LY e

=]

5

T T

2 {0 20m?) of conditicned

1 ealeo e
EaA - BN

ot m ]
fEry ey w40 R vy

1+ i onedetloane o oA o
e N A T a e PR o A g 3 A ey 5 ) % 2 ey &
100 F+
o

£ e

p =

2
7

(4D T fond oy S
LRI = I 18 i =y o | A S T

19 o fon
= T
ot
RS ) Wy L=

P

F
(=)

AR T e

ceraal

PN
Lo

CTITCOY

.1

&oF
WS

-

1ok
FLIY ¥

romid o £.0 1
U TIT L . e L

.
2

£
| I N R e iy

e YRS S (g on
U™ oo o e

S

an ELPNENEEE X Y P
(RS PR A = Sp & g iy ) = ' i Ay
fOE Tiay

LMY

=) 3
[ B e e

A

=

oo o g o
[LISE B R AW g oy o vy o g e

=l
|y

31
EaE A E P ap S |

1341

ER W)

oy pods e
Ty oIty

L

fl
3

LA
L P S e o i SR b

ooy

Wk
TS F

L=

L=

=

Srren w1

e
TEoC

ke o
LS ey P e
et o)

4+
o oTTTr

IRTEWSENE S P SN ey

O ey
J SE=F Sy

L._l_gu.\_.u.\,.-uu

[P S Ry oy

3 ey e Al
T I R i e e o e

cen o o

1,

1
a

.
7

A o
L4 = o i

T

S
L= )

FN i = PR TR S
AT R v sy )

o T
L I I O ey &5 e

IENEE S e NS
L o i o i i

L

T oo

TR COWUA
CoL AT T.F ¥

Y
VT
f

ol e

FEEET WY R T I S St P, | EENE TR =AM PP N o b . S
o U PO TCC— Wit

e
[ 3 =y e ey v e

Pl S

TITenS
b N
OOt

ot

f g

9 L\l Sy e iy .tJ_i_tJ\_- AP Sy ) j:J-LtJ\.d
L1y sy

g 1 3 o~
LA e e oy y

PR

ok o

1
UULle:JUJ.J.\_'J‘L Iy

o o eyt gy e
(oL S v RNy oy iy e

= IR ]
[ESE= A A ey i B P S S A~ Ar e
P2 W S SN P

Injpo el

I P

o

]
2

L.I.prlnllg r

d- o oprpr ey ]
[ B N oy Vi = e

S

£

2y
[y L oy

S
=

]
o

ERNE
TS

AR A | Foye
[Tie JL W st ey WPy & 1 Wt o Py B S e g

Caran

[ 5 20wy v R W

Oy Yy m o ey

EL NN

CJ-\A\.—\.:ELJ.UL_\.‘-
= A3
S tJJ_LrUu.lJ.L.

=y oy
T [ e )

£

3

cim el L de

[ s LRSS
Yyge o b

| N % 2 s e v B Y

o] d s
= L m

N
CLEICE
1yt

et am o e de
[y S A STy

L—lt)_tJJ.\J VAL

LR

ey iamer e 7] e N W I S
L S A A S 5 g B e a5 1y ) e

.
o

iw)

'

a3

Tr=

CASE S e v
AT LML e o ¥

BT Eas

pur g

e A ™ ™

vy ] 3 o

EEEN= IS
(S 2y A A~

BRSPS

V= NP e
LA I B A S ey e el \_a\-iu..l..t.lll.l.bi.l.l._

ol Gmv s +lonan
Upppoito ooy Ut E

O s
It

e
¥ LN Hp o i iy oy e )
LEN
LI LW vy [

Al
= 3wy

b o

L O O R Ay e B

1

Lok S ER W E T

L.JJ_\.;V\;J.LL;

T

3 e

K]
(,I.LJE.J..LQLJ.JL/W

T30 3N

[
E=S ¥ fuZal

Maamarf o sk g an A

ENEE N P
[SES Sp= rye

31y s e o

=

1

4

PN

LAAYS Y o g w2 S - of Wy wny o g ey

=3

LA [S0J0 0 N o S S

L P ]
Bl 0= S ML 38 A A LR S R e e

RO L e B B o)

o a1 e T oy e 4
[ e e ey ) w5 i s e Y ey w5 s i

£ b g

h"‘l"\(\l’/‘\‘v‘ﬁ
3 L ¥ ¥Aw L i)



faloN kol |
T

P 0 S N PRy S e
[ AN N I mL i )
$oo ]
[ I N A g P o R i s, o

W LCIT

e o ] g ey
L= A e B ¢ i e

L

Kl
LK

Ciyn o~ ey o]
ST
= o ]
[(=EEaw,

£

1~
=

ENEV I S |
L= 3 L s ¥ i 4 e ey
ot o

T

CD_EQ
T

e

L=
I

EE oS- SN i I S Jeod cm o
[EE T 3= 3= e may =) (A~ =

R
(ST Ay 3 L e

e e v
LE1=N ¥ Ao Sy

LSEEEENEN
D g i ey

conbErackiorn —af Fhoa oot et
LV S W N S i i 23 P g g o LS it ey
3o

|
iy Ay

.
At

Rz —n A oy
EA = F T ey W

£ 1 o
L I -t e g e 4
ra N |
Ry
o1
[ B e o g v o

LS S Wy 3

Yoo coa
[ 3 ST e g B =

baofrre

‘

A

_t.I_Lk)_LJ.J.g

PR N M N =N
(% e i g m i

Seyan g e
= ey i p

I oy
.J-..J.J.\j

£ ey e oy 2
A - (S L)Lrl.tJL—fUJ— L=
=1 1

LY
IS =gy

S e s e o
L= & 5 R i g g e

L

STTW S TT

= ST

ANy oy

.
e

=)

2
g

L o
| ¥y o

T
WLt

1z

.

~

Sl 2 o
T

u_l.t_)\_.luj (ST Y A_/_Y

"...LA\.'_}'

[

P PR T S|

Rl S PR 5

A

VY

4 R,
LR [ N DR N R o i

Do

2000

FICIS I ) SN Y

W _ LT

J v s

|

[ NEnTalion
A B Ry

Famay
e OO

Clavdd
200097 Y
25O,

] o~ onde 1
o S ey e e e
[MTTA 70

2008 LYY S Lo |

[ gy

\.IU.LI.LJ_.I-I-,I,.LA.J.J.\’\J

m
[ =,
TN N

Jatam
o o g

1
Lo oy

)

T

LY

oy
L% N W Ry 2y

2

ot
AR Y= e

Fivm Dot ot 4
LI LI OO O

1
LTI

Jy vy

iYL L°1°r

VINTE

Fompnmm Ll 90NN
L=F ¥ A p v v e
P |

L UATTE

OV o

‘t)J.u VI DTG

LR LW L -

AL T
A P =

P

1

+ = =
0 AL SN A R W S b i o o e g

I3

-n

L7708
7

L I
.

perp e fS A

=

'
E W ]
21 A e s g

1

3 e ]
e T

ey

-~

i
SN i S o ™ 5 Vi s 5

Rlom g mer y ™

Frdmgmyn o4 e
LT T 2 Pt e e 1 5 e v e v e

b B ]

£ i

LI gy
A0

¥

T£
T

=

-

3 crde an g T b
N O ST B Wb iy W R e W

|

1o ana o
= TN W S S el ey e

ESNEWN
[=3 2}

R
IRV wra W ' i e

o . R | SN | RSN I
L-l\_—J-.J.I.L-J-La\_\J\.A Loy vy yuu [S ) wry e 5 L T LT

LN |

o e 1
== i e

it T A e, o
V_LI_JJ-J-J.L.LJ_\__Y L

o~

Xy

1
\=F ¥ yoy

Ty gnd gney
QT S Sy oy vy

CE . .
fw e m

XL

ol |
[y = = g

£ mode
[T W W B g m w5 h ey ey
R | el
NI S bl wry . g by \AJ_J_\_-LAL—\JJ._Y J.LlU\.pJ.’

]
4

PP S

+1n
CIire

ot o Al
| SASE a5

IS N,
TS OT

Evy

Tl
ToOo O
tad Iz

FaW-T

qr e e o
L= g e e
= =
[ S oy

I '
ST AN W R g b g s WL g o 4

ol

Pl NL Y L
[ TR -

3

]
L L P, ST T

£ g e

ESREWN
= ¥ 3

w -
LS = e e o o
r )

g oy

Iaiza 1 A

= oY
Ly iy s

ool

1
A

Ot 3 L8 o o
N I B N el i wry Sy

T

i
FLRE S 3 e e
= = P

1 aleo ] o
ERASS R TR e S s A S T

=1

Aoy ropn g
p

Aoy

12~
= i )

1.1

ol
[ ¥ X & o gt

e e o A0y A

TPy o

ooy
TOUTIC T

]

o oo
ISCOACES e a—)

3 ey o

g g

oo o

£

18 wpe fon

el A s o A O s o i

o EoNr =P |
Tt

2
oy

2

ot ol ]
B ¥ e Y
gl

PoNECIE. NPTy RSN S vy
= RS A R ) b7 B wy o iy s g
fo] ot
1Y LJ-LLA.U’

I
AL e iy ey

S o BTN T
AN

i BN Y

fLil4 0 s = 40 e g

P
g S A

an
o ]

£ 1.~
Ty
PENS

(== xawd

2

na-tl
L i e a5 5 =y v
T ot ro o Oy

1=l ]
oot o i

£y
T

PR P
LtJ.UVUAth}U\_-\_:
N S

EAS AT T

S PPy R
LN vy

I3

\vj

WS Ty
o

L o
£33y o
[l i awp ey g

O
oo CHCTEE
PR |

1y

K

=

4

|
ot One

L
oL

-

13l ads
[ELVA ¥ 1 ot v v
IR N
LR Sy e n S S g g o g DY g )

£
S B EEPT S

WOy

ot o

LN )
CITT IS =
1

31

L1 E SN
IreaTs
P SN |

1
A ey

3

£ SR 3 e i e g o gy

fRelbfalal
=A==y

4

SN S~ A T I
SN L N S gt m, g e ey
£

LN T |
LTINS \j(.A..J_.\.J.

creo ] o om
[ a2

=
| g o ey

.
£ 4
rot—the

S0 B R . P e e 2

LI =S R
L= M e S g Ry o7 e ey

PR

E=NEN
CIT

et £
LS [P MrAN iy S s S A Y A7 N Py

=

uumyuux.l’l 7

ey Fralag e N TN
CNTCTTY o ot e O OOt

ln oy
(@ =y

TR,
TR

4
L-:Y’p 1

FE S I
LY I Ay

13 o
ey

|

Il =Y
[ 7 1 2 s

Pa i I M~ TS SN
o Ty

MEENEY
SETA e S Ay

EENSY

LI P RIS
LR =y Y |

=

AL I v o e

3zl

N I I
LTI T L—J—J.J.\_:d

LI I e
wol oo

R e e P
(=3 ¥ 1 g s s g ) e

el E S EENE e V-
LA SRR T A i M = A a1

Lo
e N~ s

1

o
Tl Tr

Aol

g gmgn o
LR = i ey

9

ol o e

ol g G =P RNy

(RS RUASE M o S g L5 B F 5] & o Py ]
RSN
[ S By oy > g e e w5

Ajguas

=

PSS = e

Ay A SNEVN

Lo
VWL

oo PiRCT =
EES NV P

£r1Y o Yoo

fS mp oy ey et e gy

1~

JE s Pt i ey

B = S~ =y

the

ol Ao o

3
LR A S S A I

I

2
ol e 3

PR
1T

e ok o
[ RRE & A o g my

el oot e
e L e B g g )

Cor |
oo Cio oot

TIra/ oL

crde and ey
LS SNl iy m S )

LSRN P S A P |
J.J.\a(J.L-\_oJ_,

m

LG SIPO NEY
(=2 A wp i o W & e i vy S R

ST

3 e ]
o o gy

Moo

P N, I T B RPTS
WFEITO T [ S S Wy
LY P, E |

A= ey N o g

RS N et

.
K

L)t S Ep M WY 5 i e e

LY =

=
\= oy o

Yo
PN EENPOR SRS

LA WS WL ¥
R e e )

o D~ F-F
FWisin

L2 ol R Sy = e ey

S RNy am e e g oy

P SUENEN RPN ) S
EE AL ey o5
P= |

A SRRy ey mn

1
O
e 1

LI o 0 & ey ey

L p gy o oy o AT
oot

room—hoat oo 1 mgmdean 3 o~
Yoo Tty O e eT

rde el
L U2 W " g g s iy g, v v

R T MR

1318 XL

CEELYN

£
[ e

S o
LS = )

C WP SN SR SN Y
i

[ Ry v

1

o™ 10T

- 1 o e s vy

L]
L3y o iy gy ey

T omi s o oo 1y
LA ST Ty IS AT o e §

-

RN I i ey e i iy

Faagen oo o

AREreval—ar—the AT al-en- Tt d e Y
[S3E4 m m & g e T =A™ 1 X1 Ry R e o MW s I T Py - e S 2 e 9 B

R L TN
LALJUJ.J.

B NP
LT T O

o

I e

shalt

~F

o ]
LI LN % i B

LA~ i
TN |

o D

Foorry

i L

LWL W Rt )

LTSIy

1+

g o
[ 7 S s iy e

£

uh.'u.\_;\_,u

P I e
[T v ¥ ALy i v e g S e

1330

CIYN N o

N I R P |
R R i gy v iy - i i

I e

o o

IR e

iy oy

u_t./uu\.,u

L IO




latnesl + .~
Ly

FE . .
(3 ¥ 35 sy i 4 e oy o e 3
Tt
[S.  t p w

cpde ne 3 e A
EATF o =y A

LIPS
Wi TTre

LN
pwa
E N S S TP

P S e
(=7 § = gvmu m

oY

Dy oy
(o) TA= A==y

e P |
vt —Co T oW -
|

I sz

tral oo

ERP-REY

LW K

FrdThe X F

1.0

J_\_I_I..L\JVVJ_I.L\j

£

(% X1

ooy an ] o e oy
oo OO TEE

L=t

.
2

[ L ¥ g e LT

VLSS

[N i wry

LA S vy g

O 20N
o=

i
p=

=

Ty e pn o
LIS " BN WP \IT

IT
L=

Iy ouxr a g
IO A IR LT

Nz
E L T ey Ly

C-INe o |
(=T & g sgusy

L]

2l

LS SR T Sl e a M & e e g

Azt 3 ]
TE Tty

'
Bl 0 v~

44
V=Y

k RENECE TN
1T COo—OoOT

T1
p=)

L I Oy

N T LT
vt

Inoayr

el
[0 ! i eor g gy 2y

AP YIS
L e e

Jun

LS FENE SIS AN NPT TR S S I
11;.{.1_\.’11&—4.)/ (==L i e up ny PRI g

.
=y

£ 1.0 20
LT o T — o=

ITLENT P
N

IE
o

BT B Oy
LIV =3 YN erpraquunaenwaiyy
T S

L% =

LS TN

P S
LT 5% 3 = =

(= ) = = mpe oy
£ TE oy

D

,
oo o

ETo

)

Tyl ]

ol
FMi e e e y g

=
-ri

=

T

Tard_de

WY

T T 7

F i J S R NE R PO PRSP |
=

TIv

2w
IOy Iy

e o e o
LT A =R A g My = o ey = 3

oy e

T e O T

AT 3 3 At Ty

[ W by gy 1

=
=3

szt o ) orn o e d o
LT L Ry T O Wi gy
o A

PO ST S S

131

o
Liu.l.tllll.\.—ll —

r Aol 4 o 1]
L SR m Ay pa S S = e e

e L I e

ala 1 I T
[=F ¥ 1 = e mpm ey g

Pl

==
AR S ) N e

q

.
oF13 9 Ty

u\-iL.L.J.. L Y S ey i 2y

e

2 RN
Eoi e ) A e

3T
LAY AW 3

ey

D,
A 4+
L")

3 L=

S
[ R e iy g g g U )

. '
CLamIn s e o g oy e o e
=% § =

R S S e m

o
AL
o £

il

'
J

R N £ 7
Wit — oo T T
treomd b

E3 2N

=l

NI TES
PO Ottt

1NN
LR v A

PN E RN R i B
R Y N e T S
EN N NS |
TITo o=y

f NP1 & W P S g wrd

L A

I3
LR = N ey i g

P}
=y

v
K]

W OIT

i g~

PN a4

L A
4
R VR I A

L b e Pt

L t—tu.x,._t./uu\_.

=1

]
R CI
=

4
[ENR P T s By S I

NN

1ot

LWL

ey
WITT T

Lk

Pk e W WY
uk-'(.—l\.a\_;

J Tz e ey
T ey

1

4+
L & s

L.

113
(ol T = m e a

1

o om e 3
P 9y

0
o =

Tk
[ W U A ) o A M7 N S W o

J 3 oiig

2 |

J M W e i NI W S

1o

g

—~

EENE I - N £
mreohiho—ox

Qo oy
tJMrJ_llluJ.l\.oll L=

=~
(=3

e D |
o pTe Y Ot

SRS IS
[ g

W = N RPN NP |
o OpeTrCty

(SRS
EIE-CR B, PPy

qt
A e Ty

g

LS B i L LY WP u )

'
3 o

ot
[ DO W Ve LU gl iy o i PR LN 2y

oo | NPT
P gy gt

af +h =
LI B L s

o0l od oaen -
S I Y O Jy WPy R B Ll v L\ AL By ey A e -

E=W-}

[ A i wery

. ,
FRNE

oy

AND

T W dm a

T

Ao2 9 1
oo 23—

q 204 2
[ e N oA T S
af .. O
CT—IC

Ti31l=xx

AnIESE P i
[ S S ey e g g

af R
L iy E5Y e

LS NN T

—
Lo S 1 o O Y X

leodmard +
[ S e v g my Sy o Ly

ERECW R T

e
p i =

a1
(534§ = o= e

[ g g

FoL TN

e e O T vl

0 o o R R N AN

_
o

latod +

ER
e [N A O A A PR e N

In o

PAEEWoT SR IC PN L CR o £ S I P B |
RN W A bl w e e - [ N iy e ey | LT LT

137 ] vy
TEPPTY

17
[ e 4

S PN e
[Ep T T = g o vy S~y = iy = g v
Kl

P e |
Fog v i L v e e

oI LE T
L= g v n ey oy

LS ey # yu

rzid-l. O
LTI

W

'
J-oncs

e
oy T oesS

oy o

2 ey

ENWS B EE T A =
S XA~ G~ A e ey g

=

Ity vz

a

[£ Sy S S WL e S WA 49

iy

af 1 e
oTr— oI

Mi e |
1

1o

&t
[ R Wl g my g

gy ] v 2
Rl 13y =y

ol 11
[=F e a= o=y

] e o o
(=T AT e ey = i w2

2 o de

=N
L e ay i iy )

Iy
o

11

SN

(il

In -
S p ) EReSS—Sa T

e

P EEWEE SN
L= 3w ey

| 20102
T =TIy

Ty

Tiqdsr

SRR TN
[ S e e g

mEE

oy

P SN I I S
[ ¥ g g e ey ¥4~}

oy

1341
|FACERR TR v g~ 3 wra s oy

Tonleacge 4
F=L-Te e ny g

E RN SN T
LSRN B Py

S e s yna g e
CoThore T aC e Ot

T e
[

LT Y
VAT

hoan

ey

aho11 v 7
[ F 1= o e Fat v e s ey e

oLem

1lanle

M~ ]

cicd- w
Ly ey

e em
TeoergTr

LT
VLAY

D

|y y oy vy

oo LTy

eguat—te—b—cfmper 100 £t%-of conditioned floor area—when tested—at—a

I

11
it

LRV I S |
TG

=~
[ & iy

£

Wk
(SR ey .

LYy = =
ool e
[RE P AT = e

RN S S ) ORI~
LIERS IO

4

| SE— i Ay =

£ 0

a1 o
LN S S SN E e N e P N P R o gl by R

2

=

P WO R R
J T = e g v

SRR hea Y P |
s TrOnoros P v e
Ao

P |
e = e v Ss e o oy 2 1

At
L 10 gt

=]
ol

LSS E LWL VR STy S
LU= o gy o iy ey g g i iy

KIEET= R S S
[ A P LA.\AJ.L.l\j [ L

EEECW—

gzt
Ty o LT

T £
g =

I Hpe—d kb EEW-T )
Lol 3 A ) g =

=N |

BN B IPLRE =T
but}\r\_l. LY g =y LY S I R B ) o s ey
PO SO N

1o
L4~

gl T
[ R3S K g

o s
AW by ey

R v S ey e
1
(=5 Fa

Hh e e ey

tatal
OO Taw

de ey o e
bbuh’

£ o
T

ERCEN
CCItC—C T

4

TITS

O S B P |
[E O Y S r R  e  § [ o puuy

EEWN
o e

.
oL by

I ] ] o e
[T L& PEAY o= oy e oy

o
L i B sy




100 F2
i -y

Vi ISR =2 PNy
R = 11N A e A v

A~
(==

be 1 = NN S NV P |
T Dot e et

Fol S |
CE T 155 ==

daonleaoes
EaAIE e =

P

C
S [ I g
L N NV’ e Sy e i e W

L=

+1 2

]
70

N PN Ny
[ = S ) o g S e 4 0 I e i s 1 8

S P -
T

= 1 -]
L3 1 e & yu s =

Bl

—

I b ] o e
L3 591 % i o my e

£ +h NI
Lo B ey = N

4
e

f 1\
L=

W]

e
LY ==

TIVE Ty

(TR Y

b

]
2

4
EA T AT L By v i wrps By WP i 3

P W

b3
T oo C T Ot

g o Don et
LS

n=

(v (e A LS
Lol = SR e L o R W A R S [ vk T = o

T o]
LR

v

RIS
LR A=

Bl ek pm s o 1 )
L My S e

LTI S Y b SN AP |
Syl oy N o IaTT

L jp ey iy

|
(= 0=y

e

(=) S S~y o e = e

P |

EErRe e o |
[SF3iswrsyw sey w4

£a
Tho

205

Sh A1
[0 B =
E ot o

ol o
Ty

2019 .

af N~
L4 e s v

N
— O
L e NS )

Pl
LS Sy S ey

Amadly mone doyy

[ N Yy Sy,

= ar-onrg

Faw

FEWLLILLLC YT,

LTS UU.&--!

o NANES]
v g oay

q1.0
vy

LJUJ

2014

'
d e WMeme s
L B M wrh oy S N T et
ol 10
LDITIToTT

e

(e g

E
~r

5

[ S o e

oy

Paa .
A o e

Mot.:
LW

He b mmnyy o
T e Oy,

oy

1Y

LI X Yo

1 2014 TEL 4o
[T aen e Sy A g M S e B T

-
.LU’

Taanan o sy
U‘J.lll.l.u_Lj

LR e I
THECr

TXNT

D ey



013

&

oy
2fk

5443

=09

209

33+5h

L3158

R

—5

F

T

835

3048 mwe

10 jhod it o
ot Td

radhnond 1
Teaucee—ay

oy 3 pes e
AN

[l mide raon VSISl fatal
U T oL S Aot i

TS

3 s o

G- e—RR

B R=—ratae

shatli-be

l EVS
T O THOE

T
T

15

ELANE W I 4 Y Sy V13

(=T A= T2 By A gl S 8 2L §
1 43

oG CIOR

E XTSI
(S =awra)

T CaVIEY

d-lnotde

vo ot

n

£33
ful i Fatal
s

e
T EEnRe s

o )
-3 Bt

EE- v o

Saa-l]

ERN
CO— i
BT |

+
e G

4

=32

2r e ]
R—vald

Ce—E e

o
55

A
€

to—ali—glaz

oGPPI es

hi

b NETINCY

ml
11t

S Y ERTET

oles

ot =4 [ oy onoan 1
reSeratron—tU-Ffactor <

£
I

42
Exa3

5

-THOTH

r omE tha b
F—or—the

e oy g
eXTeEL

nsttaked—sheonrsrhin 1 EES P
STICaThi-Bg—Ooi—ene Interier

LIS et

By Fre
T~ CORNCERIONS

in]
L= A

R-I0—eawi

an

fhad +
=24

permitted

basement-waldl-—plus—R-5 contintous

Ce—5a

1Y ey
a5

oSl

3T

Nl g

13
Tt —Wotdt <
£ =3
T

o

ECE]

et
THe—IRECTIEF

T

$bnz damman] o
T ad t o0

wath 17 ~
WEE—R—LJ—CaVEEy
ot d

yoed
et

10 —centinusus

"

)

A=t
(=33

=
=

3z de
CHRCOELI0Y

E

L T o -tk AN 3y,
AP A= o o =y 3 A R S § e oy 2 S o g 2 S S S
Sbkha e

RGO

ER-W-E T |

E TP | = E
avityfnsulationab the

a1z

an D) o
T—r

2

sehpged aon ety
*Eerier—ef—th

EXOF

Bt ad ook i = ok
e atnE g o —the IRt

EITS T

FN

+

o |
o

PETE BEW A

TR Ut 00

1
o

laipo £ N o N BN 2 1
vor B S r - Rea T e e 51an sy
ASNESEN 0N

Wi CFT

.
Eas

: dolah ad
regurrea—otab—edge

=

Tt

4= b

dednd 4+
o ea—t0
dankl
CePEit

oh~1? o
[EEE 1z vy &)

k I ry
T

CLW.Y) N S
O Ou—o TOE

Ehoe

E% a—loc EECN PP
I =554 0nes

i

EPEE. e %
[ St

e
TOOETERG—OE

T1r

3
L=E

FEREY
Tt

iEY

= |
Srrgen

e Fo—]

T
ot
o]
o
K
) Fi
H ]
o
I 5
- 0
=1}
il
Fa o
£ bl
s
o 4
L [
o b
- A
4 ad
o]
o
4
l4n ] H
n] ]
n n
& ©
- -
- e
ik wH W
3 I
L
&4
i f
o ko!
-H D
= .
B i
& H
- fia
] qr
& v
i -
x
It
7]
-H -1
] 0
] o
4 1]
- =
5
i i
D
EY -1
)
ab o
wH M
L =
]
D 14
-H -4
] P
D +
- -H
jis) - "
o] 14}
i - D
-
0 o
£ | b
0
v i
rH
ol ai
Beh-al f
k3 &
N
)
D H
ic4
i
2y Z
1]

re

WIC

Bro—jo—fat-reomiiaeand rh
Fo—hoe-regquEred
AN

by
T T O R Ca TR R

otk

=1

ey A i) e e e
Er3a=ar

CoRTOES

aande | o L 152N
Spercent—or less—of th

5

COV

3o PotE 3 £l
o PeECeT oo
At b e e

I

3 FaoPaEey
FH—Hore

S ELTERH— OOV

PR R |
STreceRrar—ah

T
&

sl
HSCC

ner
fRy =TT T = EaT e )

I gl

ST O TU S5t

frfraaan =]

4z gny

EF R BN T = ]
T 0a St

£
CHERET

P
ST

+ o

LRSS AR P |
EN e a=r iyt s

eSO Wt

CP-CoEow B Y]

ISEEECe |
PP

oh=0 1.
[SF 3 1= =y

thing

P e edeiiaaa I
STERCtarar—sheathing

LSS S A7

1t

€

F o oo
F—TheHass

E Ao
CHe—EIrEeTr oY

a8

>
I

™
Eosasas sy v

ol £ o+ 3 s
iro- 0

koo
thaf

more

113

raly

s oy 4
vt C—a P8

n
£t

el
THE—GCCOREr

ol

erpational

g

1)
i
b

.

D
;
O

3]

&
-4
o
H
My

]
om
b

Y

g

D
e
+

Y

®

&

)]
4

i
|
A&
4+

P
wo

L

4]
o

o
ol -
[T )]
[=r Rt o]
W
- D

@

L
B (L
Fit]

L

P
Vi)

Jur}

o 0

D ol

Do
D -H

D
Py

s
e

oo
i
4h
o0

1
o
N oH
b &

o]
s

L
LY ¥ A Ly e g

10
_LU’

Yy

L

r

e
1LY S

2200
Tt

4.7
T

1 Q7370 &
LTI IS

—
L LT

P2 LR NEV

1
[P e ey W

af 7]

Ao
LTASA A

Ausdtin mmad deey
L= JL=T ¥ LW A my I.-J 0

£

M

td l-vul.-'x

Histery:

EPTR ey

[-ArRL Y B orauy

2017

J.JLA_Y

¥
3 X

A
LTI N I WAL Wl Ry A * gy

= 2030 .
ColY - Rw s vy

1

]
-

Tiaal - s =
A v g my ey T

Ty

LTV




305-2-4-,09. Residential Building Codes. (NEW RULE) The
2015 International Residential Code (IRC) as modified below.

{1) IRC CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS.

(a) Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems: For this
code, an integrated and complete system of pipes, fittings,

heads, and other components assembled as required by either
P2904 or NFPA 13D.

(2) IRC CHAPTER 3 BUILDING PLANNING.

(a) SECTION R302 FIRE-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION.

1. R302.2 Townhouses.

(1) Exception: A common 2-hour fire resistance-rated wall
assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is
permitted for townhouses; plumbing or mechanical equipment,
ducts or vents shall not be installed in the cavity of the
common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from
both sides and shall extend to and be tight against exterior
walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Electrical
installations shall be installed in accordance with Chapters 34
through 43. Penetrations of the electrical outlet boxes shall
be in accordance with Section R302.4.

2. SELF-CLOSING DEVICES.

(i} R302.5.1 OPENING PROTECTION. Openings from a private
garage directly intc a room used for sleeping purposes shall not
be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence
shall be equipped with solid wood doors not less than 1 3/8
inches (35mm) in thickness, solid or honeycomb core steel doors

not less than 1 3/8 inches {35mm) thick, or 20 minute fire-rated
doors.

{b) SECTION R312 GUARDS AND WINDOW FALL PROTECTION.

1. R312.1.1 WHERE REQUIRED. Guards shall be located along
open-sided walking surfaces of all decks, porches, balconies,
including stairs, ramps and landings that are located more than
30 inches measured vertically to the floor or grade below,
Insect screening shall not be considered as a guard.

2. R312.2 WINDOW FALL PROTECTION. Where window fall

protection devices are provided, the device shall be installed
in accordance with Section R312.2.1.

(i) R312.2.1 WINDOW OPENING CONTROL DEVICES. Window
opening control devices shall comply with ASTM F 2090. The



window opening control device, after operation to release the
control device allowing the windeow to fully open, shall not
reduce the net clear opening area of the window unit to less
than the area required by Section R310.2.1.

(c) SECTION R313 AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS .

1. R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems.
Where installed, automatic residential fire sprinkler systems
shall be installed in accordance with Section P2904 or NEFPA 13D.

2. R313.1.1 DESIGN AND INSTALLATION. Section deleted.

3. R313.2 ONE AND TWO FAMIITY DWELLINGS AUTOMATIC FIRE
SYSTEMS. Secticn deleted.

4. R313.2.1 DESIGN AND INSTALLATION. Section deleted.
(d) SECTION R322 FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION.

1. R322.3.5.1 PROTECTION OF BUILDING ENVELOPE. Section
deleted,

(e} SECTION 324 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC ROOF SYSTEMS.

1. R324.7.2.2 HIP ROOF LAYOUTS. Panels and modules
installed on dwellings with hip roof layouts shall be located in
a manner that provides a clear access pathway not less than 3
feet (914 mm) in width from the eave to the ridge on each roof
slope where panels and modules are located. The access pathway
shall be located along the structural members of the roof
framing to support any person accessing the roof.

(1) EXCEPTION: These requirements shall not apply to roofs

with slopes of 2 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (16.6
percent) and less.

2. R324.7.2.5 ALLOWANCE FOR SMOKE VENTILATION OPERATIONS.
Section deleted.

(f) SECTION 325 MEZZANINES.

(1) R325.5 OPENNESS. Mezzanines shall be open and
uncbstructed to the room in which they are located except for

walls not more than 36 inches (914 mm) in height, columns and
posts.

{a) EXCEPTIONS: Deleted.

{3) IRC CHAPTER 4 FOUNDATIONS.



{a) R403.1.6 FOUNDATION ANCHORAGE. Wood sill plates and
wood walls supported directly on continuous foundations shall be
anchored to the foundation in accordance with this section.

Cold-formed steel framing shall be anchored directly to the
foundation or fastened toc wood sill plates anchored to the
foundation. Anchorage of cold-formed steel framing and sill
plates supporting ccld-formed steel framing shall be in
accordance with this section and Section R505.3.1 or R603.3.1.

Wood sole plates at all exterior walls on monolithic slabs, wood
sole plates of braced wall panels at building interiors on
monolithic slabs and all wood sill plates shall be anchored to
the foundation with minimum 1/2-inch diameter {(12.7 mm) anchor
bolts spaced a maximum of 6 feet {1829 mm) on center or approved
anchors or anchor straps spaced as required to provide
equivalent anchorage to 1/2-inch diemeter {12.7 mm) anchor
bolts. Bolts shall extend a minimum of 7 inches (178 mm) into
concrete or grouted cells of concrete masonry units. The bolts
shall be located in the middle third of the width of the plate.
A nut and washer shall be tightened on each anchor bolt. There
shall be a minimum of two bolts per plate section with one bolt
located not mere than 12 inches {305 mm) or less than seven bolt
diameters from each end of the clate section. Interior bearing
wall sole plates on monolithic slab foundations that are not
part of a brace wall panel shall be positively anchored with
approved fasteners. Sill plates and sole plates shall be

protected against decay and termites where required by Secticns
R317 and R318.

1. EXCEPTIONS:

(1) Walls 24 inches (610 mm) total length or shorter
connecting offset braced wall panels shall be anchored to the
foundation with a minimum of one anchor bolt located in the
center third of the plate section and shall be attached to
adjacent braced wall panels at corners as shown in Ttem 9 of
Table R602.3(1).

(ii) Connection of walls 12 iriches {305 mm) total length or
shorter connecting offset braced wall panels to the foundation
without anchor bolts shall be permitted. The wall shall be
attached to adjacent braced wall panels at corners as shown in
ITtem 9 on Table R602.3(1).

(1ii} Where the basic wind speed in accordance with Figure
R301.2(4)A does nct exceed 115 miles per hour (51 m/s), the
seismic design category is A or B and Method GB in accordance
with Section R602.10 is used for a braced wall line on the



interior of the dwelling, anchor bolts shall not be required for
the wood sole plates of the braced wall panels. Positive
anchorage with approved fasteners shall be provided.

(4) IRC CHAPTER 11 ENERGY EFFICIENCY.
{a) SECTION N1101 GENERAL.

1. N1101.3 (R101.5.1) Compliance materials. The Alabama
Residential and Energy Codes Board shall approve specific
computer software, worksheets, compliance manuals and other
similar materials that meet the intent of this code.

2. N1101.4 (R102.1.1) Above code programs. The Alabama
Building and Energy Codes Board shall deem a national, state or
local energy-efficiency program to exceed the energy efficiency
required by this code. Buildings approved in writing by such an
energy-efficiency program shall be considered in compliance with
this code. The requirements identified as “mandatory” in
Chapter 11 shall be met.

3. N1101.5 (R103.2) Information on construction documents.
Construction documents shall be drawn to scale upon suitable
material. Electronic media documents are permitted to be
submitted when approved by the building official. Construction
documents shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the
location, nature and extent of the work proposed, and show in
sufficient detail pertinent data and features of the building,
systems and equipment as herein governed. Details shall
include, but are not limited to, as applicable:

Insulation materials and their R-values.
Fenestration U-factors and SHGCs where applicable.
Area-welighted U-factor and SHGC calculations.
Mechanical system design criteria.

Mechanical and service water heating system and
equipment types, sizes and efficiencies.

Equipment and system controls.

Duct sealing, duct and pipe insulation and location.
8. Air sealing details.

Ut o N e

-1

4. N1101.6 (R202) DEFINED TERMS.

(i) Projection factor. The ratio of the horizontal depth
of an overhang, eave, or permanently attached shading device,
divided by the distance measured vertically from the bottom of

the fenestration glazing to the underside of the overhang, eave,
or permanently attached shading device.



(1i) Semi conditioned space. An unfinished area of the
dwelling such as the attic or crawl space that is insulated as
to limit or prevent air infiltration and maintain consistent

temperatures commensurate with those inside the thermal
envelope.

5. N1101.7.2 (R301.3) International climate zones. Section
deleted.

6. N1101.8 (R301.4) Tropical climate zone. Section
deleted.

7. N1101.% (R302.1) Interior design conditions. The
interior design temperatures used for heating and cooling load
calculations shall be a maximum of 70°F (22¢ C) for heating and
minimum of 75°F (24¢ ¢y for cocling.

8. N1101.11.1 (R303.2.1) Protection of exposed insulation.
Section deleted

9. N1101.13.1 (R401.2.1) Tropical zone. Section deleted.
(b) SECTION N1102 (R402) BUILDING THERMAL ENVELOPE.

1. N1102.2.2 (R402.2.2) Ceilings without attic spaces.
Where Section R402.1.2 (N11062.1.2) would require insulation
levels above R-30 and the design of the roof/ceiling assembly
does not allow sufficient space for the required insulation, the
minimum required insulation for such roof/ceiling assemblies
shall be R~30. This reducticn of insulation from the
regquirements of Section R402.1.2 (N1102.1.2) shall be limited to
500 square feet (46 m?) or 20 percent of the total insulated
ceiling area, whichever is less. This reduction shall not apply
to the U-factor alternative approach in Section R402.1.4
(N1102.1.4) and the total UA alternative in Section R402.1.5
(N1102.1.5).

2. N1102.2.2.1 {(R402.2.2.1) Semi-conditioned attics. Where
table N1102.1.1 (R402.1.1) regquires R-30 or Table N1102.1.3
(R402.1.3) requires a U-Factor of (0.035, Sprayed Polyurethane
Foam (SPF) with a U-Factor of 0.05 or R-value of R-20 shall be
deemed equivalent to the provisions in N1102.2.2 (R402.2.2).

3. N1102.2.4 (R402.2.4) Access hatches and doors. Access
doors from conditioned spaces to unconditioned spaces (e.g.,
attics and crawl spaces) shall be weatherstripped and insulated
to a level in accordance with the following insulation values:

1. Hinged vertical doors shall have a maximum U-Factor of
U-0.20 {(R-5 minimum)and comply with Section R-316



2. Hatches/scuttle hole covers shall have a maximum U-Factor
of U-0.05 (R-19% minimum) and;

3. Pull down stairs shall have a maximum U-Factor of U-0.20

with a minimum of 75 percent of the panel area having (R-
5 minimum) insulation.

Access shall be provided to all equipment that prevents damaging
or compressing the insulation. A wood framed or equivalent
baffle or retainer is required to be provided when loose fill
insulation is installed the purpose of which is to prevent the
loose fill insulation from spilling into the living space when
the attic access is opened, and to provide a permanent means of
maintaining the installed R-value of the loose fill insulation.

4. N1102.2.10 (R402.2.10) Slab on grade floors. Section
deleted. '

5. N1102.2.11 (R402.2.11) Crawl space walls. As an
alternative to insulating floors over crawl spaces, crawl space
walls shall be permitted to be insulated when the crawl space 1is
not vented to the outside. The band joist shall be insulated
and air sealed in accordance with Table N1102.4.1.1
{R402.4.1.1). A 3 inch (76mm) inspection/view strip shall be
provided immediately below the floor joists to permit
inspections for termites. Crawl space wall insulation shall be
permanently fastened tc the wall and extend downward from the
bottom of the inspection/view strip to within 9 inches{229%mm)
of the finished interior grade adjacent to the foundation wall.
Exposed earth in unvented crawl space foundations shall be
covered with a continucus Class I vapor retarder in accordance
with Section R408 of the International Residential Code. All
joints of the vapor retarder shall overlap by 6 inches (153 mm)
and shall extend up the stem wall not less than 6 inches {153mm)
and shall be attached to the stem wall.

6. N1102.3.2.1 (R402.3.2.1) Glazed fenestration SHGC
exception. In Climate Zcnes 2 and 3, permanently shaded
vertical fenestration shall be permitted to satisfy the SHGC
requirements. The projection factor of an overhang, eave, or
permanently attached shading device shall be greater than or
equal to the value listed in table N1102.2.3.1 for the
appropriate orientation. The minimum projection shall extend
beyond each side of the glazing a minimum of 12 inches (0.3m).
Each orientation shall be rounded to the nearest cardinal
orientation (+/-45 degrees or 0.79 rad) for purposes of
calculations and demonstrating compliance.



7. N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1) Installation (Mandatory). The
components of the building thermal envelope as listed in Table
N1102.4.1.1 (Table R402.4.1.1) shall be installed in accordance
with the manufacturer’s instructicns and the criteria listed in

Table N1102.4.1.1 (Table 402.4.1.1), as applicable to the method
of construction.

8. N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing (Mandatory). The
building or dwelling unit shall be tested and verified as having
an air leakage rate of not exceeding 5 air changes per hour.
Testing shall be conducted with a blower door at a pressure of
0.2 inches w.g. (50 Pascals). Testing shall be performed at any
time after creation of all penetrations of the building thermal
envelope. During testing:

1. Exterior windows and deors, fireplace and stove
doors shall be closed, but not sealed, beyond the
intended weatherstripping or other infiltration
control measures;

2. Dampers including exhaust, intake, makeup air,
backdraft and flue dampers shall be closed, but not
sealed beyond intended infiltration control measures;

3. Intericr doors, if installed at the time of the
test, shall be open:

4. Exterilor doors for continuous ventilation systems
and heat recovery ventilators shall be closed and
sealed;

5. Heating and cooling systems, if installed at the
time of the test, shall be turned off; and

6. Supply and return registers, if installed at the
time of the test, shall be fully open.

(9) N1102.4.5 (R402.4.5) Recessed lighting. Recessed
luminaries installed in the building thermal envelope shall be
installed sealed to limit air leakage between conditioned and
unconditioned spaces. 2l]l recessed luminaries shall be IC-rated
and labeled as having an air leakage rate not more than 2.0 cfm
(0.944 L/s) when tested in accordance with ASTM E 283 at a 1.57
psf (75 Pa) pressure differential.  All recessed luminaires
shall be sealed with a gasket or caulk between the housing and
the interior wall or ceiling covering.

(c) SECTION N1103 (R403) SYSTEMS,



1. N1103.1.1 (R403.1.1) Programmable thermostat. Section
deleted.

2, N1103.9 (R403.9) Snow melt system controls. Section
deleted,

3. N1103.10 (R403.10) Residential pools and Permanent
residential spas. Section deleted.

4. N1103.10.1 (R403.10.1) Residential pools and permanent
residential spas. Section deleted.

5. N1103.10.2 (R403.10.2) Heaters. Section deleted.

6. N1103.10.3 (R403.10.3) Time Switches. Section deleted.
7. N1103.10.4 (R403.10.4) Covers. Section Deleted

8. N1103.11 (R403.11) Portable spas. Section deleted.

9. N1103.12 (R403.12) Residential rools and permanent
residential spas. Section deleted.

{d) SECTION N1104 (R404) ELECTRICAL POWER AND LIGHTING
SYSTEMS (MANDATORY) .

1. N1104.1 (R404.1) Lighting equipment (Mandatory). Not
less than 75 percent of the lamps in permanently installed
lighting fixtures at the time of inspection shall be high-
efficacy lamps or not less than 75 percent of the permanently

installed lighting fixtures shall contain only high efficacy
lamps. '

(e) SECTION N1105 (R405) SIMULATED PERFORMANCE ALTERNATIVE
(PERFORMANCE) .

1. N1105.1 (R405.1) Scope. This section establishes
criteria for compliance using simulated energy performance
analysis. Such analysis shall include heating cooling and
service water heating energy only. The code official is not

responsible for verification of compliance for documents
submitted under this section.

2. N1105.3 (R405.3) Performance-based compliance.
Compliance based on simulated energy performance requires that a
proposed residence (propecsed design) be shown to have an annual
energy cost that is less than or equal to the annual energy cost
of the standard reference design. FEnergy prices shall be taken
from a source such as the Department of Energy, Energy
Information Administration’s State Energy Price and Expenditure



Report. Building officials—shall be permitted to reguire time-
or-use pricing in energy cost calculation.

(f) SECTION N1106 (R406) ENERGY RATING INDEX COMPLIANCE
ALTERNATIVE .

1. N1106.1 (R406.1) Scope. This section establishes
criteria for compliance using an Energy Rating Index (ERI) .
Such analysis shall include heating cooling and service water
heating energy only. The code official is not responsible for

verification of compliance for documents submitted under this
section.

2. N1106.4 (R406.4) ERI-based compliance. Compliance based
on an ERI analysis requires that the rated design be shown to
have an ERI less than or equal to a score of 70 in both zones 2
and 3 when compared to the ERI reference design.

3. Table N1106.4 (Table R406.4) Maximum Energy Rating
Index. Table Deleted.

(5) IRC CHAPTER 39 POWER AND LIGHTING DISTRIBUTION.

(a) SECTION E3902 GROUND-FAULT AND ARC-FAULT CIRCUIT-
INTERRUPTER PROTECTION.

1. E3902.15 Location of arc-fault circuit interrupters.
Section deleted.

2, E3902.16 Arc-fault circuit interrupter protection.
Section deleted.

{(6) EFFECTIVE DATE. For purpcses of enforcement, this code
shall become effective on Octcber 1, 2016.

Author: Karen Clifton; Bret Warren

Statutory Authority: Code of Ala. 1975, §5§41-23-80 through 85,
as amended

History: New Rule: filed April 5, 2012; Effective May 10, 2012,
Amended: January 16, 2014; Effective: March 18, 2014

Repealed:

New Rule: Filed




APPENDIX A

TABLE N1102.1.1.1 (R402.1.1)
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY

COMPONENT @

I ABd
FENES- SKY~ GLAZED CEILING ggﬁ MASS FLOOR BASEMENTC 8 R- SCPI:;F;Ln
CLIMATE TRATION LIGHT FENEST=- WALL WALL
—_— R- WALL R~ VALUE WALL
ZONE - U- RATION VALUE R- R~ VALUE R- & R-
- b b, a i
FACTOR FACTOR! SHGC VALUER VALUE: VALUE DEDTH VALUE
1 1.2 0.75 0.30 30 13 3/4 13 0 0 - D
2 0.65 1 0.75 0,30 30 13 1/6 13 0 [t} [
3 0.50 3 0.65 0.30 30 i3 5/8 19 5/13¢ o 5/13
4 13 5/10 10
except 0.35 0.50 NR 38 19 10/13 ! 10/13
. 2Lt
Marine
5 and
. 20 or 10 10/13
q i
Maifne 0.35 0.60 MR 38 12:5h 13/17 30 10/13 2ft
20 or 10, 10/13
6 0.35 0.60 NR 49 1345k 15/1% 309 15/19 pres
7 and 8 0.35 0.60 NR 19 21 19/21 389 15/19 o B
For 8I: 1 foot = 304.8 mm,
k. R-values are minimums. U-factors and SHGC are maximums.

Author;
Statutory Authority:
History:

R-19 batts compressed into a nominal
2 x 6 framing cavity such that the R-value is reduced by R-1 or more shall be marked with the
compressed batt R-value in addition to the Full thickness R-value.

The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed
fenestration,

*15/19” means R-15 ceontinuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or
R-19 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. ®“15/19” shall be permitted to
be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R—~5 continuous
insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13"” means R-10 continucus
insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the
interior of the basement wall. )

R-5 shall be added to the required slab edgc R-values for heated slabs. Insulation depth

shall be the depth of the footing or 2 feet, whichever is less in Zones 1 through 3 for
heated slabs.

There are no SHGC requirements in the Marine %one.

Basement wall insulation is not required in warm-humid locations as defined by Figure 301.1
and Table 301.1,

Or insulation sufficient to £ill the framing cavity, R-19 minimum.

™13+45” means R-13 cavity insulation plus R-5 insulated sheathing. If structural sheathing
covers 25 percent or less of the exterior, insulating sheathing is not required where
structural sheathing is used. If structural sheathing covers more than 25 percent of the
exterior, structural sheathing shall be supplemented with insulated sheathing of at least R-
2.

The second R-value applies when more than half the insulation is on the interior of the mass
wall,

For impact rated fenestration complying with Section R301.2.1.2 of the International

Resgidential Code or Section 1608.1.2 of the International Building Code, the maximum U-factor
shall be 0.75 in Zone 2 and 0.65 in Zone 3.

Karen Clifton; Bret Warren

Code of Ala. 1975, §§41-23~80 through 85, amended
New Rule: filed April 5, 2012; Effective May 10, 2012.




Amended: January 16, 2014; Effective: March 18, 2014; Repealed:; New
Rule: Filed



TABLE N1102.1.4

EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS®
. Fenestration | SkylightU- | CeilingU- | Frame Wall U- Mass Wall Floor U- Basement Wall | Crawl Space Wall
Climate Zone , , , :
U-Factor Factor Factor Factor U-Factor’ Factor U-Factor U-Factor
2 0.65 0.76 0.035 0.084 0.165 0.064 0.360 0477
3 0.50 .65 0035 0 084 8,141 0.047 0.360 0.136

a. Nonfenestration Ufactors shall be obtained from measurement, calculation or an apprCNed source.
b. When more than half the insulation is on the interior, the mass wall Ufactors shall be a maximum of




TABLE C402.5.2

MAXIMUM AIR LEAKAGE RATE
FOR mmzmmqmb&._.z bmmmgm_._mm

- MAXIMUM

_umzmma.wﬁﬂn.x }mmmgmr.x. |RATE ﬁmguﬂﬂw.. :

TEST _umﬂwnma :mm

'Windows 1 0.20°

mggm%aw | 020°

Skylights — with conden- | ) 0

Skylights— all other | 0.20°

CSA101/1.S.2/A440
or
IFRC 400

{Curtain walls 0.06

Storefront glazing 0.06

Commercial glazed __
S o H!w
swinging entrance doors

Revolving doors | 1.00

or

| ASTME 283 at 1.57 psf

(75 Pa)

| Garage doors - 0.40

Rolling doors | 1.00

High-speed doors 1.30

ANSI/DASMA 105,
NFRC 400, or
%wg E 283 at 1.57 psf
(75 w&

For SI: 1 cubic foot per minute = @ ﬁﬁa 1 square foot = 0, cm,m m>.

a. The maximum rate for windows, sliding and swinging doors, and skylights is
um;ﬁ.ﬁ% tobe 0.3 cfim) per square foot of fenestration or door area when tested

in accordance with AAl

wz?_ﬁm%m 01/1.8.2/A440 at 6.24 psf (300 Pa).




VIEINIIVICIVE £ e OO WJIN A 28 Ol A o I\
ORIENTATION PROJECTION FACTOR
North >=0.40%
South >=0.20
East =0.50
West >=0.50

a. For the north orienintion, a vertical projection located on
also satisfy the mininum profection factor requirement.

the west-edge of the fenestration with equivalent PF >= 0.15 shall




TABLE N110552(1) (R405.5.2(1))
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE STANDARD REFERENCE AND

o PROPOSED DESIGNS
cgﬂg‘gﬂéi.r STANDARD REFERENCE DESIGN PROPOSED DESIGN
Asproposed
Y15% of the conditioned floor area-where-the As proposed
proposed-glazing-areais-15%-ormore-ofthe
eonditiened-floerarea:
Glazinad® Orientation: equaily distributed to four cardinal
g compass orientations (N, E, 8, & W) As proposed
U-factor: from Table R402.1.3 As proposed
SHGC: From Table R402.1.1 except that for As
e . - proposed
climates with no requirement (NR) SHGC = 0,40 0 92-(0.21 x SHGC as proposed)
shall be used.
interior shade fraction: 0.92-(0.21 x SHGC for As proposed
the standard reference design)
External shadmg hone
Heating Nyl g o oreial Drond
f' > X
8Systems "¢ Euel tme same as grogosed demg
Effsciegcies As proposed
Electric: air-source heat pump with prevailin
federal minimum standards As proposed
Noneleciric furnaces: natural gas furnace with
prevalling federal minimum standards As proposed
Nonelectric boilers: natural gas boiler with
prevailing federal minimum standards As proposed
Capacity: sized in accordance with Section
N1103.6
Fuel type: Electric
Cooling Efficiency: in accordance with prevailing federal As proposed
Systems™ minimum standards
¥ Capacity: sized in accordance with Section As proposed
N1103.8
As-prepesed Aspropesed
Euel type: same as proposed design As proposed
iy Efficiency: in accordance with prevailing federal
S,_elmazi ngﬁr minimum standards Same as standard reference Same as
eating Use; gal/day = 30 + 10 x Nbr standard reference ga#day—%@—t{-’!-@-x
Tank temperature: 120°F Nbr}




