APA-1

07/04
TRANSMITTAL SHEET FOR
NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION
Control No. Department or Agency _Alabama Department of Economic and Community Affairs

Rule No. 305-2-4-,09
Rule Title: Residential Building Code
XX New Amend _ XX Repeal Adopt by Reference

Would the absence of the proposed rule significantly
harm or endanger the public health, welfare, or safety? NO

Is there a reasonable relationship between the
state’s police power and the protection of the
public health, safety, or welfare? NO

[s there another, less resirictive method of
regulation available that could adequately protect
the public? NO

Does the proposed rule have the effect of directly
or indirectly increasing the costs of any goods or
services involved and, if so, to what degree? ' NO

Is the increase in cost, if any, more harmful to the
public than the harm that might result from the
absence of the proposed rule? NO

Are all facets of the rulemaking process designed
solely for the purpose of, and so they have, as
their primary effect, the protection of the public? YES

sk ook e ek ke o o o e sk ol sl s skeok e b oot st ok ok ook ol ok e stk e e ol s oo ok s skl sk ok sk ok ook sl ook ko ok ke e sl sk b sk ke ok ok ok ok
Does the proposed rule have an economic impact? NO

If the proposed rule has an economic impact, the proposed rule is required to be accompanied bjf_ a fiscal
note prepared in accordance with subsection (f) of Section 41-22-23, Code of Alabama 1975.

ARt e ol ol o o o oo o R Rk ek s ok o e ok ookl ok o ok s o s e sl s ok o ok o
Certification of Authorized Official
[ certify that the attached proposed rule has been proposed in full compliance with the requirements of

Chapter 22, Title 41, Code of Alabama 1975, and that it conforms to all applicable filing requirements of
the Administrative Procedure Division of the Legislative Reference Service.

Signature of certifying ofﬁcer_MMM%ﬂ&Qu}w

Date 0\\ 24 \ 20\58 (DATE FILED)
(STAMP)




APA-2
07/04

ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC AND COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
ALABAMA ENERGY AND RESIDENTIAL CODES BOARD

NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION

RULE NO. & TITLE:
305-2-4-.09 “Residential Building Code”

INTENDED ACTION: Repeal and Replace

SUBSTANCE OF PROPOSED ACTION: The Alabama Energy and Residential Codes
Board, under the Alabama Department of Economic and Community Affairs, proposes to repeal
rule 305-2-4 .09, “Residential Building and Energy Code”, and to replace it with the provisions
of the most recently adopted Alabama Residential Building Code.

TIME, PLACE, MANNER OF PRESENTING VIEWS:
A session for oral comment will be held on Wednesday, October 21, 2015 frem 9:00 am until
10:00 am, at the Alabama Center for Commerce, 401 Adams Avenue, Room 342,36104.

All interested parties may present their views in writing to Heather Gopgin, ADECA Energy

Division, P.O. Box 5690, Montgomery, AL 36103-5690. All comments must be received by the
end of business on Wednesday, November 4, 2015.

FINAL DATE FOR COMMENT AND COMPLETION OF NOTICE:
November 4, 2015

CONTACT PERSON AT AGENCY:

Heather Goggin, ADECA Energy Division

401 Adams Avenue, Suite 560

Montgomery, AL 36104

(334) 2425330 - Codes.Board@adeca.alabama.gov

- e

DAL Blivvied B

Claudia Kennedy Smith

Alabama Department of Economic and
Community Affairs, General Counsel




3

1o

f TS

L M A )

Reat dowmsd -7
LN IO I T T r T

L

l
-

LTI

= 1

WAL L iy

ey o
[ 9 I L e e sy 5 v

20006 T

oo ] CIFEE N PN I
L2 e 2 A v g g o e e v

Falr Py
LTATA &5

m}

irc—2oo s
= 3 A
(=3 ¥aw

falrae=|
ATA e

L=

(g g o oy~ 4 3
RNTNP L B I g sy ' 46 2 SRl L 7 §

DN B L TN e
LITC Oy

.
2

Tt mgrgn ~ b
LS e iy i 42

[= ) ¥ gL v e i

I

LW

ot )

=

o1
WL LD

ot ol
LT

E L

SV = I S
JH N En Sy L ML NI R SRy Ry e 7 B9 A LY )
110
i [ P

13

Troats
£ pomag

P TS L S =Y
Aot OoT 2=
WL CrIT

n
X

A
)

e TIT . D2
L SR T =

A

[P0 1N i my At

NN P LR
[= A By = 3 e

=
o i .3

]
<

[ B,
[ S S ey oy

ool vy
Lo pies 11 v

Lo T SN gy
LJ..LU.J.I.I.U.J.J.Ig

3
coTreaE Tt

P S

LN )
T

LEW- NP | ISEEVLVE SN 1T N i = |
LT oacTwaoT o &

Er3m b
LSRN L A AN e iy e

LS.

£
[ N iy

Borma e o)

tl\.— LI OO

E R ) =P
=3 ¥ 3=

o

T e
CovITy O

1
| S N

=
Tt
£ 3
g
i
e
PR ENPNENE S SN A e

.
3
v T o

L o |
P =

ENCW. I N

1 e Fe Tr oo
LT = ANy i v s
PR

bt 2]
1Ty

e e 8
L iy =i

P R
FLIASTRY W R i i = o e

PN
forgn

PSS
LG
4

ko
AL 3 St e iy .20 e =
oSzt man A b
RS TOTRT

oo~ 71
CET 1S T

Tz~

D~
T

L L O R

X2 |

OTRHI O
botls

LTI ey
FIACTT

P IR S SRPNE O S LY
LT e e i

(..L\:’L-I.-L.lll) L=

1 o

s I 1S

=1~

N

ot e
[ S s CATICK

EAPIEN, |

Pt LY

1]

ey

a4

£

LR LW ENE VY BN

LS B N
Hor

£ 17

LIS = S N NIy W mp WY o g

[T S S 2 N ¥ I

L= A o L e A T hra~ax=
P SN | EEP= S |

L oy

Tl ]

WL

24
T

EE P .k S LY e
A= B A=y T g ey S

L S e i

1.7

oy e s e 2] oy
[Z RN Sy i ey

=

4
LD

P I <l
[ 217 I M el i Wy = e e

1

[
E

LAWY

LW

[ N AN WP % R E I o gy ey

& N [iH]
O D
-t Aw . Aw
¢ i 4]
o J A
Bl
1] H m
H el i
a5 : % : ¢
s &
) L
th A . &
N it
% il
D N M
D i3} q
A0 -H
+ L] +H
f nm &
H @
4 - E o
s 4 .m
> ol i
n & ot
i p il
(Y] © He s
b} =4 £
-H H i3]
B8l D ™ A
4 rH ¢ 1}
(] ~H +
D €@ . £
~H -H L
) & o &
. 0, N il
uh h &
D b & B
1] LTI} .
frs - - 2l
D G 4P fis]
- (3] : i
4D H @ A D
0 < @ oh by
s M - &
1b vl 1D G e
b o) o 4P
e [ AP &
® w . 0]
s - R
o QP o
p O
. o6 o
oh i) [
~f 0w i
-H & e .._.._
AR b O 1y} mu
m b ﬁm (M ~ w”._
hin] & - L
D @ g &y
i 4h
Ky i 3
4b M -H £

CIF-E S - X | T
o

LIRS SO T

1l oofomng o
L S s e ey o

oy

.
oo o A LN S

AN

L X e

= ")

oL

LT ST P e g v e L i

Loy S

A= =

J AL =L R W i

| S = 33 2y S oy

o

o

n

Tr3 o

o

af
L =

13 +xz
R I = Py v e e \__Y

PENE N BN
Ll Y ¥ Ay

PEN W SNSRI SRR S PP
p S ) S iy v A LR N =y
srect-label o

AT p

e
P

-

T OTIITT OO

=
Pt SN |

Xy
LT g LW =

o

LWl
T C
Cl oy gy e

R S, L I
[ N o mym g
e e A, 1
.LLI.L/\.J-L’ [ =i S " e WP

ASEATE M s mpn At = o ey

PP Lk
T |
L S Ly T N Py Wy \_tlJ_J_\.t\J\—\J.L}

i i e
Pk Bt

EoN =Y

[ T e
klul.) L-\.uk.A.’
£he

A=

SO TN i P DN
P 3 rae o T

=1
Lo it ey

ool ot o] Ty

=

hENEN

Voo
EI - Py

S e e Ay gt e o vy

FoRLuE

P P TN P LEn LN
T e T o il

EERNL [ gt mp my

LT, A0

e AR A E ) e o e p v e vy

oFf

T 3 e o
oYy T OOy

T r3-1

LA™ o m

atllad 3. Ao oy o
[= I S WY A E e LT p g by LT
P |

S 3 o

Pt

]
4

1
[ S N P 2 S R PR e s

LA W EL ]

of
L gl
o ol
‘L.J.J.(,l)u‘f

PN P o BTN L T PP
kJ.L JSS LR R A N ok B Ay LN AU 2y Iyl w e

3

[N

£ 7 A

cern ey e o RN W

Lot N )

T

I

EE S JEN A R
oo C O

£

O

[ mw o e

IR/ O

4 e iy ArOW o P eT

IO CTHHo TS

PICTu I

Wk Lo F

L |
(2]

Fanmaoct ot g o mam .
[N Sa M i A e i o i e

£ e

Footoro
[E Lo i wiy e e

I
AY

cornddta oned oo oao s
SO T OGS PaceSs

TR S I~
LS O N W e v

SR - EE ST e
L=y AALOLTENT

P

3

3

1
Lo 8 iy

1o VY AW =
LIS N B M R G iy o iy e L B Wy
1

A PPy S

L

FRalafalal
\UJ.J.\J\JI

Lot

5o

£
[ NS P B B PR by g g

1o b o4 2. e
o an

3

[L -

[ S T

LA F $ 3~
a1

£oF
LR e = 3= uy 3

[ e Y o o oy

deln

[y i

et £ o

=

e =
TS

PEESWoNEE T T PN analk
=3 =a>ras
faXt 5}

SN

Cara]
LIy ey

[ o e

[0 o % & 2ym g 5y
ot +h

e e i
L

[ e WA ) b e I S B - o i

LT ey =1

T I e i o s iy

TITTLT

Mo
TETC o

£

o

TN

PR |
[oEY (= g

bt S o
T WY SR Ul B S S WP & ay ey wr
oy ]

T
TIIC

o g =y
oS

41y AEEELY
L=y ¥y

FAPLL T VN W]
Rl = == A

NN

A = =

Ir

L e

.J.l_lJ-\:j\.-b_)\‘ (&=
£ bt

TS Too— O

1
BN or
THOTE L-ln.‘g

PRI S
WS T

]
Lot I P

o
LTI Sy v ey

o8

5

RS g o A |

o

]

3 3 e
RIS e oy 2 oy

o

]
Py o o

£E3 o4
o o o [ g mp W

2 ]

=



£

L .
14+ 1
T LCIT
o =
L gt g

2

[ o ey

X

ho
Ly v iy
Aot ogn sy
e
L
LN T
sk s
willolm
s
.
3 v

[
—~

Myl an g
Alarn e o e

ux.,u.uu.\j _LJ.J.H

Fagmmo e
af £
bJ_-I..I.\.aJ.\_oJ-lLﬂ_y'
Aol
f W o
ﬂ
020
e O
e
-
TS T
i
[N O B o S Ty 4 g W L I Y

LEL

Lo et
[ Ly e s

-
[ S WL P ey

L=3= M~ ~ e v )
3 ]
4
IT
o
LT
o
3
Arpairn
ul
T T TIT T
Yy 3m oy
LA A S s e
13 o
Oyu\_.-\,
.
ERCNPEE ]

ol ot e 2
Ll Sy e e T

B
31T
£
= an =
Filh W = T A

T

.
g clon e
L0 T AT SR v e 3 g
ol oy
oF

"

TS ot

POE ST
ot T o g aace

P
oY

.
WP |

o

e
L3 S S e ooy S

oA 0 Ty s
=
"
L33 1
vy oy ey e e

or rle_l.LlL;l.llL-lJ.l_.
JF N S S g

-
ol

SN AN o gy

ol

T

tarly e
WITCaT
= e

4
.
S

[ 3 Wl bpem vy v it

o o
g e o
N

TR S TTTTCTT
B

=

1

e ot

[ S o nf vy ey e g
ul

L= = St S g
o

Yy o g ey g f
[T AL oy e e

=
-

ok

-

1
[ S
oF
Ve ey
b P e B oY
[ S I T U A (e P P W
17
oI
=l NN SR P TP o i
LY N L ow ay ey k/.l.\_avl_plj.'.-b_)
O . P |
L.IJ_\JV_L\A\J\JL
=
LT
LA i ey .J,....LV.L.LJH
1

om
T OO
ik
vy T 5T
~

4
Co— T oY IOt

J
ot T

[ Ay e o
E=p ETe e e g 5

O
Erar iy

Ev

L& X1

rio—Tx

ST
[P S B | S e w i

I rdon oy
T

o=
oo
=y
| AT S AT e
o
T

VLS o= L
L P BRI

LT AT

trol1imen e

-~
o3
L2 7S

e

am—hoad
LLATAwAG §

RS
LY

-
FRiie gy gwiisy

o]
I/
.
ey
-
w2 vy -
.
NPT IV NUE
By

NG I S SN

£y
.
Sy
-
Ty
por g

5

PN
W UITETETT

-
T
1o

.

1
S
PR ]
RATOOTAS

5

e
CITs o

oo ]
L= KL w )
Lot

[ S AK W U gy e iy e g
[ [ gy

i

Y

1

EEE T TSNS e |
[l e = i ¥ 37

oy oreCor
EEECY LYoo |

L off g e g e

1
=
e gy

Lo N |
%% ¥ Sy gy
1

-

LT A ey
JoL e o

Co——r=
1y

|

moe

P

Ty

Toaxr

PR L= Ty

A

.

=

LNEE B Y
(=¥ $ywy

L L™ I

£23 mnd
[ S My g w

s
1
£l

[ Rl o~ i Py P ey

1ot

3o
n

]
Ly LW g e

]

My o
i pve ny )
o
oy

o

113.5E

]
LAY

“

ORI e
[ER=AS pr = gy
|

LT L'LJI..L.LLJ\.A’

R

|
e
£3
[ S S By W
o
la
el
=
1
LR N B

gk g
B

LT By g s et g
v ld
[TAT RN Bain y 3y i m
oyt T oy
woTTIIeE

LY O SN T 2
L JPe W ey

3,19

LY = = o vy
o

PN |
[ g S vy
£

1o
AT SE = =§ ~a=av

Pl R TN
[ W i gy
£ o
[ S Sy y £y
1

=
Ao T e ik

T
L

(SN ST E ST = Yo
oA

P.L\_I VST

1

T OO
Moo oy
|

£ a0
PR |

A A2 ¥ Ay o
ES- W I N |

.
o
[LE QAN ey a A SO i e 5

PETW
o

Ev)
LY ]

4
)

EM W kL]
-

u

o
X,
o1 ]

LTI A S N v A A T T
.
J-o1]

Fel

o o]
P

o
guu
do o
£l
1

)
2
[ . = 2 ey e wy e g

Ml o o o)

[ SIS By Mt wy wy
.
[ L Ve & i g gy )
LAY 2]

1ot and o~
<

.

s

'

EIE

.
T PCCTAT

ol ]

LTINS L LI T I Ty

L™ 3
1ok
[ B AE e I 107 Mg 4 N P L i

'3

]

[ L T Ry g 4 g gy
1ot £
o
LW
Aty

[ B g B by ~ANTIWET
=,
7 L—luJ.\.&C-{J.La L
ne
'
BTN
L S S By gl i 5 W
P IR

LT
+1
LW I R )

N1 1

o~ ] ]
|
P e
S
ol =4
)
I3y
e o
3
'
RS
W W
= R e

£
T

L) P ¥ Y e
L

MY ACYENEOY
1
E AN o gru w3

&
n
3 3 o

Hotaohme fo b
LIRS T R M NI R e ey S pt e v

o
==

(S K i

alh 11

[ 3 o et e

P

L= =

1

K]

1~

+

h L A ey £ 4 R g ay iy Reppe)
£
[ S .

I
T
ot
.
A

1 oot~
LAV U
T TR
'

1 oo

£F

L=

Lo
o B 5 T M |
<

EES SN

oo T oo
'
el oo o~
T oo T T Tice
1 o+
. S A T O A Y ) i o i
e
llLu.I_J.J.l.-k—l..J_.lL..L.J.I.\j

4

UUJ.I.I.LJ.I-DI_)L_J -LIJ.H

T o A e e
o £61

=
e
=1

P I oG
P N LR L
i g e 2
.

=eld
pEL T % A oy e o e
o o ey

o
LU N R L Sy W B, )

LI EE|

[ = Sy e
Loy oy g o Y
[ = = e
j g, e ey e
JL 7 5 i s g

D
LW s

Do oo o

rala i Y,

LI N S g s w30 iy e ey
o o oy
P I

[0 L A R vy

o
-

o1

SR

1
T OTICC

4

e 2
L= S e g ¥ AN

-

PPN SR I
[ O Ry ey LI
i P 8

1 iy od o
T = SR v e Ay
ot o

|

i i WoT i W g gy
EaL TR T= =1 -= 4 = =) w j 3 gy

MN11iA=2 2 1
[ R e
1ok = o

I Y
viEy

12N
oI

2019
[ e J
LS )
4=
elans g e
[ S g e
E N I BT oo

BN ZNPEN

EY

TOTCATITT UL

1
=T
F=

o

[ R

5 o ey
m——eh

| A N vy

Ty 1ls

AT
Yead wn o g g
TOT T T TP TRELCT
o]
[E AR AN iy e 3
L LT

=

S L B e e

1

3T
=]

-
4

O
PARRWAT ~HEE o

AU

oo
i I A T i e FEVNVOA ¥

P S i g
LSS IV Lt gy ay )

LN e
CEIESWOTE . W S S
oot
et o LW N WL LN o

A= SR v A R el i 4 o 5 e iy

E =y

'
1
LAWY
T

g
CLLET W T I
CE W e

.
[
b o

i
44

]

2

FNEEY
J_.LLL..LJ.L\JLJ

L I ey

I~
I
=

Sy an v g
3% M e gy 1 g e i o
C PSP TN )
(=L T L3 s
Pygmde o
ey ey
PN S SN
f g
Tl o mm
L B e v ey

P SN |
[SF 3 £ g il i

[ = 5

P
ERRETR

.

=

1

(= i oy =y
LSSV oy 3 e e o o e Y

a

.
K.

ol

+ ~ e

LS NP B 3 R i O W ]
[ P,

= Y
iy~

T = ey

3l

TAaTeP T O
Fod

kT
LR N )

4+ 1~

C W=k
[ ¥ I i g g ey e

Aot

l.)\.p!tJbJ.Lj L L R W g i
4

Iy

oy
PSETA SN P
AT

.

[y

a1
1341
L4 v S ey

P N
3

[RS4SR A= ¥ 15 3 = 1
ot

POER TNk
=1
LS N ey
LSRN N I N W S b i 3
4o B
L= -

~ 7
L
ey
+ -~
ey

L= g

Iy -y o



»
£ 2oy b 1o
WL oIt

WL P
L T e my e oy ey

L

1
vy

| PN EE SN |
DI T e ettt et

=R S |

Arn e
(varawas

PENE SHE I SN NP
oL LT 3 A e . i v e e

1 o By

1

.I.La.l-l\j L §

3o

rao ot

= o £ o
tCTirTo—o T
Ll

el

Ind I~z

108
LT Y

4o

CARTY

PaE L NP S O B B T

=

P S i |
L= ¥ o e ey o

1

ooy sle
T s

o T ooy

U PCTy

ARl LR 2 g e e o g ey 3

=R LR
T S e oy v

il oy ol T .Y
(2 it gy o gy

cxrod s ee
WY e oy

PR LR LY.

=
[ o S S L R vy e v g

TAYNIN g

£y

ok T
i s

O3
T

oracylemds g o o
pS =T RN oy B AT

goa ] = ok o
(A= = = ey 5

£l

EEE S L e

I

PRI T N

ol all o] ag

= EEE o
o Th

P, R
34—1—‘.5—]!2

o1

1

P S IR SN
Sy T T o OS

salem s

]
L

oeme]  epa e 5
Wkt

[= Ay

Aot l

LA MLy

1917

[t T S PR 14

crrrord e
\J_y W EASTITT
P
L N b e

MM o e
T

T TrY

LN
Ty

2 rre e

4+
(S0 ¥ S my g i =

T

el L LY W R
ERL SR = ey ey = B i~

1odin D £
[ S . =

LT 10 o P R

Lo
f
r 1 O1n 17

[.2.'% X e

4= 2 o
[SRSF Fy i g v m i
ETE I =N P
T oT e

=
faGce may iy g
et

p2a3

Cren oy n

.
tad il
L = miay m=p iy 3

X W |
oo

EREAST 11

oisrerd e
P |

P NPT R T
L m e e g gy ey

A oy
ToiS

L NP Y
[ ER g Sy i A i

ot o
A= A=a ey

oy~ 17

Fne
TT

L L e .

ekt
E Y N at ey e W A=

o

cearer iz vad =1 [T
[ J S R g l_rul.l.l.h_’.l._y WL LTT

oo

Soymrs o oy
SR I ¥ 3 Ay e

an

i
Lo, R .
19010 FV =

[ gL )

LTS I |
THrcr

EIL N PP
P g ey AL

L'l

121 R, 04
i ey

3= o
2=y

v
3T

+
[ Ty == my=

cLoany o

P S LY W W L LR LT
Laliod SR Spt = e g v s e

rsy

LN 1
T
b1 I |

[y g o g g

LN

[ Ep e =y ¢ i o

1e1p

.
S s ]
LTI E R 2 g o = e

o

= NN N

2

fronan o e o
AT OIS S I oI LY
Pl 2= |

Lot - |

+

3
P4 e o gy wrm my gy

6 Jr o i g e Tt gy

L i 3 A vy g v i

Ly

[ g iy

oy oo ot

i oy

L

o o
B S oo iy g w4 e e

£

1

14

LY P RC
| N LR WA s o o g ey o i iy

=
(A== ==y o

P EEWE S

=W
ot To

L2N

[ I gt S B i

.
L

et  coma s e
[ F A g ey e

L. 75 Py E e g = o wy e

W |

Lo CoITOES

oot s

1o

L
M
1
H
&

I

PPt T WS
SOty

ol 1

o
o, g

ot l 1 3
TonnrC T T L O
I T

£

LS SN PSR I e I
XTI

LAy ¥

P NN |

1,13

Fal

ay

ri1.91w

U R W e s

(= = g g oy

= e

[

= N |

P EEWE T
A== A oy

P 2N |

LLYENE T B CONE SN
oot
A0 pnrn
o
Jencd + 1 e

Lo TOOT

3 o an

=
T — O eS

[lan ) e

-~

heo w1

= s AT

R Y o y=mp m

p3ad ey =y e
R |

ey

[P Y 1~y

LT %% ' S W e
£

p

1% 2 A Sy i 4 g g

bax

e
=i

L3 I SV e i 39 i iy

oo
i ey

laogecd 11 /9 3~
[N o e g, e e ray

4

1=

nf o a7

=

-

LR SRR i Ny N Y ¢ e )

pyiciy)

[ AR > S A = =

cer o
A =
.
[ Jlurg o in my

1,

£1 o~ o
[ i ey

ot ]
™AL ™ N

£l
LR T S vl v L N e

£~
L= 3 v

P oo e
Mo TThS Omis

TP S T
LT ST U_Y

mh e o] s
[Iiam R T s vy g o o ey

™

o

el +
cho et

ez o v e
(=BT e 1 )

EE 3N S AN =5 FYPN

fak WPNICEEE
TACho O

rorrma-ath o e o o
QEM\J\’M A LTI LT 3 J\JJ..L&L--
R AN | + 07T el

[EN R WAy U S E L

I |

acrnia ]ty

A I e e w4

4=
SRt ~p ey wy

v
LV T

ey
LS NN N B W o o 2 v vy ) e e i S i

g e s o]

1
LT

4

Al

2l 1
[T 102 e v mpy v}

A obey
pm R A m ey L iy

mata]
13 L vy Ury ot s my

14

+

FoNE S EE W S

= PN
Ealts E e

T

| 2012

EETE - ST R T
L U\.J._I._Y

3 PR |
REASRS |7 2 Sp ey g © . o my e

IO 3

=W SN

LEYE vy wye ey vy w g
Q
1=

A =

Z .

=r

L W S e )

A

¥

3
o

Vi
7 Ity

T

EIr e o (20 B
[y L S 4 5 Vo LUy o LT
Pt |
=9 LRy wry = e

i T = S CE-a-t
B e L =11

el
oI T O eGr

he

oo
= U0

LN WTEN
o =i 2w

=
Trieer

ser—08—E£*

£y

.
M

CITINCOT AT Crs

FERCWoN o ]

£y
=

1
L

N PSS

e =

1l oo yn o o
ELEN R A P = o= mp ) - v

A O

=

£
A

E2AY

TR

than—er—eguat—te—I2—efm{12-T/mint per 100-££> {0 20w

1

T 21
LA B

o~

b SO I NN Y
I e S

£ N
o

P L - R SR, |
L. YA i T g Sy s N I A o A fr g =y
Tt 41

a oot sl oAb o e e v
LRSSl kv e L gy e sy AV R
i o

WAl T

naraa ol
LI i ST
98 Doy

1 o nan

sl o o e
o

Moo e an
LT I L 6 0 NNy e e i S iR

Ly 3 e

EAE
LTINS oo T

St zondm oo
oy o CUTy

'
P Y

= S e v g v

P

o e
o= L Ryt e e
handlererelesure

T

h BTN

Lo

Elo g a1 4
COoOTIc T

.
-
L4 Sl woprigi e g i

T

PN |
LI Lo vy oy

W= PR SR |

AL Lo A e

I i N,
Tt

L%
I [ Ry gy

LIRSS

ﬁT—P&p&ﬁg

WATALTENT [ N By =)

vy

i I

SN

crd am o e
RTF ey ==

I
L_’.l.tl\.o
e g g e
\_J\JJ.I.L‘tJ‘.JL.l\.'.L.I.L—Q,

PR, S8 SN S | N P W
[ 4 Loerip wry &0 ppu t.a’—l-tl\.d J.j.\_Ju.lx:)’

L33 amem o ands ]
A=) AT ey

2N

[ =iy aw s
o
Crio o

3
pr e

PSE SR E T R ]
CATE LY A+ Ny v = uy & i

CEEW.
J.Jl.i.-l-..L\.nl.J_J.l\:‘

WLCTT
a1

Jo o e ey o
LA 2 A S s

[0 . 5% g e p L e
baroclesd o
L e ey e iy ey L [yl

=3 N |

P P
uu.\_—\.iuu [ Ny
4-

P I IR £
P IIgy T OT

=z

o
T — oS00

+1h
cind A

£ oo
T

1

L= R § LA TS

P G S A |
[= LWy vep o= I g Sy

[{]ANE e ¥ Lviw yug
= Al

O . YW= L - - Wl S o]

utJtJ.LU p Ly A

sroant

Lt T

=y e

[SA B & i
I

[ A R N L

£y

FT R,
[ S A N N e vy 0 R M J

o
L N oy

= o -]

PR B )
(S350 g L 4 g g ng Sy 3

e

L tJ-‘-\—l‘l'\alJ.La

P LN 20 2N
[(SASF AT L a =y ¥

LRl S B SN
(SR ey g e ay v &

e e T ]
L .LL_}.J—.{J.H
ot ol

D]
oI ST T

exren oy T o e 8
v Tl A O T,

LY F Wi
R4 L Wy . T U S vy

ey

Pt )
L iy

\.Aull.l.b} AT

|
L= =g s 2y i 5

Mg £ - o~ g

3
[ 54 2 ANIL U Rushy gury wery wy o |

=

\»\iu_l_h_u.l.l\-.—ll A=

o van e
L = ¥ A

P DR N e

r
Pt Lemy 3o ey

EA

oY SR

Jat o o

Sl S
o7 O

[ L S S e R B o LT

.
THoOCT—1oC

= o g v g an
|
T

P NP

T EE]
(4219 ¥ LW By i 1 A i

L EW. s PN
LSV ST

L BN

o] e
EEp L & . A

33T e
o = i
1 o

YNt ST S T

FAEEL =T N RY I N R =
Bellod T AR =R TAA

L

= 3 ]

Ehe  gemer1a sl e s e T MO
(RN S~ = g mys ey o S e ety vy

o1
ORI Loy

a1
[ ) & N By

1y s e o
A= 3= = A ey vy

I o e
[R5 3 ¥ aw pop oys)



1

\
4

e
'
1
r
RN & Y S e
T£
[
£
L
ax
T
=
3
|
[ i )
o
b R~ Y
™2 ¥

LY
Fx 2 o
Y e

5
=5z
~

1

e

EES Sy
£
L s

sindng
PEIPInY
PERENEN |

5

Aot i R o o et

"
4=
4
I T T
S, W

k|
LG S = = my e
FER
Ty =

i mp g mp 3 A g g S

K

L%
1I'INC
[ N 9 o R S iy p
L
T

I

[

LR S Ly

N

RN AR aron)

o
=
ESR SN
STner
R

2000
N

TITC
Lo 5

~
-Lll\_d \-u\-ibl..l.b)ll.l.\.;lll_

(A g
T

O A A
N
£ o+t

1

= .
L= AT EAT kT AT A~ e v

)

11

i

£
LNy iy
~rd
el
A L g ATrsI oo
PR e
[F SR W B gy ) LSO S & N ST s ey v
h.or
[ i & A e gy ey
ol =11
[ B iy & e ey

LI I Aol vy o o e g v g
Jo

+ha. a1 1 A

[N
)
[y
1
T
1
e g e e

TS oo
o

= I N P
=

[ S R W v g ) e

2

TS |
SOtreT
2000 1%
oy Ay
1

= = 7 4 v e

L4130 vy
LN

L= F ¥y

e 4

sy
=0 SN |
[ = gu ngu

2

Pt
CoAv R e i
PR |
EAESE

[ WP W S W i
o717
.
2 e
R

LN A Ay Wy % R R i e
[ il o g e

<
ool ]

o
o
o £
P

3

T

EEE I LN Nt
EAgOy—g UL )
O

11

PAIEIPE SR I PP O
LT S N e inp s v N R LW i

1
A4

o T ocrrimrCoe T

L] 8 AR ) P i e PR NS B W) =y
Py

™
oo s 3
B

oL TOTT
=T
+
=
TIT

2

Wttt
S 4 o
PoESEEE R |
[ Sy i v s e g & e
N
3
IEWE SRR T S T S
Rl A i e gy e ey oy
Aot o]
mooE el
o e -
ERPEN

PSR T N o

'

EI S TN
UJ_UVVJ.ULJEA\.—'V

[ S e e g i bty Y

et
g .

13

Lk vy

o
3

[MNEDA 70
[Ny ey

[N I U P Ny 5 BN e i
o1

eyt 3 e

1.

2

Yt L L e
£ e e

Lo

il

p e

-

LTI O T
£ £

L I iy

e
THC—COMp S ea

PRV SR~V
TTOT—ios
=

ot

oy

L =

I CsoLmn
kI I N |

[ RN i e ey o g g i o

PR TN |

WLy
Lo

'
Tl

4

A= TSRS ¥ ¥ Ly o

= ]

[ 3 i g
L3379y
Coadoe

TN L AT
=

oot

1

f s
e £ 4
LT S SR S s m wry e gy Sy
L=t

h_l.l. RO W vy m P o e }
3
LI Wl
I
R A £ ¥ eyt ey

— 4
SOTEaTs o
-

RS e
=

PR |

[=F ¥ 3= gumgu m
.

13

NS

.

i

Pt al
[ )5 ipi o s g

gl
Ty

=

ml

T

Xonr s

TRy DO
{ O LTy

L iy ey
=
L= 7 3=a )

ot P L]
[ e LN

T

N g e ] o ey ey
EASWEN

AT T

-
o
£ ol
L
P Mg
Rt
[ B AR gk w0 e
n
= i o
e
T
o
.
KR,
.
PP,

LR T A Tl =y = v i i
.
Tt e 4

.
L
1_11\.»_}'
AWl
O s s ey
\.—leJ_\j_y
3 =4

[ R i g 2 e it e o

2

3
oL
o e |
(3 % 3= o e
N P |
iz
3 e A
ENETNY
(= Fmn oy -

\.ﬂA!:lulllJ.L\/l-l
7
: £
LS e by Wl mige S My WY i Py
med
LR 5N
WOOTTT

k

BN =
oaTrro oo
o

A~

2000
(A=A~

'

R

oo

oo CIne T
'

ot

EEAC SRS A R A B i e

.
L
ral

[ SO N S e i AL 4% Rl By

S5
TE
e

.
Coarmaaptrat s e
.

B WL e ]
[T N R L S T 4 g el Y

e

o

o
ol ot
oTer iy

IS EN Ny |
o

oot eTr
N
(=X F 30
oy
ClIo— T
LS )
LN N i S S W W W 3 N

PPN LI
£

A1l
LrT 2
~
a3
e
AR

LR Ty o ey
E RN i P

A R I . J Wy 23 gyl i g v o
J M S S e priva ey e

ot o
LR N e W ey |

ot

EY 4

L4 J iy v

FE P
L g g m e P WY & N S
L |

A= g ey o S g g e

W~
v
'
My~
e
4

X

PRamod et

LU ML N WP N T G m e i
b

\_!I_-\-J.L_Y

3

L T = Ly gy

o
a3 o
RBao sy y
LA wr e
P
'
o
L1313
LT et iy = e |
qoman
P
LY =y ¥ 3
T T
v oo
i

h
l
[

i)

.
EEEVY

Ty e
Ly [ A l.lvu [y

e

1
o

Py

Py

[S= 0 ' &= e v
LTI Y 0w

Pl o |
W Tt
123 e
LTS
|

OTIT T
S

J.J.LJ.J.J.\J — LT Fl
o

EXIE AR S SN

Ty e oo
oo/

BN
[0 i g
4~
1 5k
J_\_,\i\_l..I.J_\-‘\J L = N W L e s e
|
J_L-\_a'rl.ul.;\.aJ.\.:M L-lCL.JJ..\;jJ.*
Haneho
AL S
SN
LTOSTIW

L2 0 I O W iy ey
1 o e

EEENE N
E BN

4
L=p i

P

L7a
EELTRY i i iy v i

e |
THITEr
IR
o
£
1=

[ my o2 o oy

N
VY
Eitctt

S &)
gt ool
l-’\.ﬂ.l-).l.l..l. | WP e
4
o
b

E L L

N S
Aominaed T

L)

P |

\JUJ.U.L./.L.I_LAJ.L\-.-\.’
il NI PN |

'

o, |
e o

g g )

4=

o
[ T Nyt A DV NP S Mk e g

ety
R

RS SR A S g g np 4

b et 1Ay 3 4y
e |

i‘l’\

U I i

L B[ R e P i > iy
[ S R N WP N I 0 ) o
=

LI BN )

e

el Lo

L N v s ) Il
N P ey
[SEEaw L= = ey v )
£

LYl R Ry

P

AT I
.

"
-

oOD_ B0

T

(AEET NN
(A=Y = SAvE oy g
CEwWeEeh
oot rrm Al
o g
T o oo

A-YeF

o 4
LITL L..LJ.J.B

3 2oyt oo B

EvY DX T

[ M7 g vy

o1

PP W I

PP~ RN SO BN
=

.
3

=

=

£

1
=2 ¥ 1=1
EENTE S
E=
= 3 )
[

1

-
Ty £L3 o
AL \4LJ_.I_L/—I-\.-,L.L\_4"Y
A P Sy
T
s
S
Y N Wi g o e Y

A

7
r

LN |
LT oo aCHCEy

=

P P oOp I e
Daod d-e

LN WD 0

Wkt
o i
g -

oy b o e

o
L ey l.-LaJ.n.)’

a

4
Sy ey an
EEF- WY
ER A F Ny
AT o by oo ~
X erit

o8

-
[ i e

N
ESN SN

oo A
crerlh
1y o
rho o eSO 1T
"
| )
-L/J

LRESETFICSE S |
v CIrCce

=
= = J
PR

o

LEL =1 =u =p =y}

\JUUJ-..I..I.J.g
ESWEN N
PN Y Y W
N
alocted ~ 4
L= SRS Wl W g )
o e o T ame ]
5(.&-.: LI g mry §
S g ey
l_l.k.l\.}l.& (.rl._tJtJJ.UVu_L

IR = oy ™ )
IELL N Ty

ol et e d o
LT
Lot eodd
[ Syl m gy w ey w B LA

[ITE S Ny b e i S
Ju O

B

o b

AL ENE PN S |
(R T 1= J= Sp muyr " ) oy 31 v g e e o

NN |
T TEoT T Cr
k

LI AW ey i
pe

Pty
L g
.

Iid

o

eguipment—Where—a

T WS e

[T I AL s s e g U g ey i e oy
L% 2 5 L

L g e %

o oy o
ah =11
(o 1. o g
P S |

e 3
557 N W U s e

o
VT

Fak W ]
W BRALAGACAT

e o]
THECE

LRSS o |
LF Ao g e e S e

| I NN [T N S
AT LTI T LJtJLI.\J\-,.AJ [Sep

]
4 ]

= o]

o
A




=
[

e I g
PRI N A W A Y B O WL

= ol

fok S N |
o TrppptioT—aTtG

LT N
woTtCieT

PR NP, N, T B P
[ Jt N A R T AN

3y oy ey

W PP e R |
53 ¥ 35 ma S i

dor srn Tl
TTho oo o oIt

P B

]
3

11 et e

[ L S -I-JJ.\j

£

et i 1 o

WL IT

WP e
| Ry e w i = o ey ey

n
LT

=

1o

P

VL LTS O

L A ey

iy

v

0. 2N
A=

AN SN £ T
T Torr— O TG

I
Loy

'
haa i P 2L L
A I

yh ol Aosane wmlaa 1T T arre o
STt et et

LI S g mp L e A v A e

7.

AL |
TR GG

=7

I e oo
LR I B iy R

o

L R TR E L
T ITT R IO

-

In o~y
[ L o S T 1= e v &

P NN W |

LT FoNL LY.

e e
R WLy 3F S R e ) i w2 W o o gt s

Ut oo o maade e ] o

s
VLT

[LLpimy 3 g= = a3 g na g

i B~ I VT TV
7

TIT

e E O = LN S SN P e
T e T A e S E A S e § 1T ey 2 =

o
LI TP s

L=

o SUE Lo SN R 2~ =

£
o AT T IR

]
2

Y

A oF

\.‘I.(Alllu\j -I-ll.\:j

P
1 oot

o

oy ey
LS i L iy b}J—Lr\f\_-ll_k—x)

oo d-rmmaiads o4

-1

2z3 Al 4
LRSS e o cR e o g ny i A

1PN NS

PR =N I |
[ 9 = mp My ey o ke v S

Ao e
3 Lerp ey w )

]
SpYH ooy oy

\.;\.iLoL.L L AL =S e iy

an

P B SR g A |
LU e S M iy o 7 1 W

T.1

i)
X

E RN R S NN e [P S
| S ey [ N AT ) U SN 5 PR S I )

\J\JLLI.HJ— e d L.)_LJ.J.\:’

Lo fe7 A

L1 o

£ e e e

Ly
g

L1 W aoo 173
LA e i

R Sedl

3o e

EES WIS I SN 1~

.
-« J.\.a\-iUL_LJ.\-\-J-

CEPE SN IR
PRI ey P mp 3 ey
ERRCT SR i s |
o Tho oGy

L

YIS AT R Mg Sy e

S L _tJJ_UV-I.\.A.\.»M

N4 N g i ey L e

Iy sr et 4 b
Loy )

[y PJ_\.;U\_'J.J.\.

CHr. |
Ju Bgres )

Wll TAaT

skt~

£

L Pud—t—’uuc L

f= )

Fl e g e

f=)

2

o

[EN R LT I 5
TIhoo oo OFt

1o
WIToIrT

rrh

R P,
QLJLAM’L»

1

el 12
RIS [ S /4 -l.LJ.\j

=L N T i B TR NP PN S
[ T S = T N 3 A e my y w

£ o e
O

ot

. . .
T T N WPy, UG
S IR M gt iy S S A e v’ e Py 0 R S I s

o4

4

P -
P SR e oy

£
meoo—0 ¢

LN =N

e e a T

oy e
t/-I-\JV_L\.A\J (=3 b}ud—lllullblih

LN Y W

S
[ g g s

PN s |
J Sy VL—I\JLL\JM’
L I

T W]
TOEoT

'
3o

L& "L YR S B )

EENN
CTt

4o
T I S T M- J W A Y o A e B i Ay

1

LW R ]

&

o
[ L N Y

+
|5 )

TN T
Voo O

n
IA)

L U S g Sy e R W i L W

B Y
CIres

o o b b
T T L—L.{J_J.J..LJJ.H

Y e o

1ot Al

PN

O~
[ i ey wan sy i

o3
(=3

40228 Slab-eon—grade—Fleoexr

fS A S M e s w ey

20712
g w e e

|
Lr

Ti3] s 2

ooy

et sz
o I o SO SN WL W B b ey

EIE PR P JENE S I

REE
ELUTE I N O By gy e, ey W A=y

af oo
O oG

CEESWST KT N SO T SN N N T A ey
ottt O3t
Ay ooy — = P o |

=N NS I . RN
A

[ T N e i e g

Pl W=

n_p
T Crs

i
LT

'
Sy e o ey

.10 9 g g OB A xS

=5

1
(>3 5 4= o o e o

'
Jerry

L T = v

'

'
4

£V 73
R AW | S g | St o 2 1

PR TNy S
SOy

1
T

.

sy ]
A= T "L =™ o

1
(= & 1. wm mpe s v i

P EEE U~ SN
L= g vy by )

-

Patrare |
= a=av &y

ISR

ozl
R A S S S N )

Ihavra 1St
e e iz g 2 A

Joints—and—seams—shal

]

LAY
TEITEr

In oz oo
rozitsT

£33 0 4 e
[ S S Ey EPy W g

—Regidential~Coder

=

IENPEN
p A

PN S I
[Re i it o = e e g

PAREW=T S SN ) ~ECNNPPY
S F 5 g oy ¥y

Tauwlxz 2002
LS L AT Py S PRV P R S 4 M 4 5

|y i B [y
il 1 P e Wy W R S ¥

==

fiod ] Loy c

be

ERPSCCNR SNy S Toales o si:dooro—oh 11
[ ey J—JUH!L(A‘:’\-— pg ey AT LN =ty mpn
Tess—then—erequal—toB8—cfm per 100—ft* of conditionced fleor—areca—or

B amaa e

P

ot
[y oy S Nl It AT B S I i ey e

{ T4
e

2

o

L3

b I IR, S
TICCS

n
=

A s 3 ] £

LY W W L ]

ENE Y

LS N I 1 S T e RN
LT

£1 -~

UVn\j-

=N

| OUC A Y B - A A ey e ey e g

L S AR e

[y gy v = g )

LA A

i e g e

E ol NN Y

£ oy

|

e
[l =T Y SR A - v =y e

ol 7

i IS PR

Mt o1

Fonod
Ly ey

L

TT

Roalicrh
LN \-I.BJ..I.

LT TN
VEL

L

T

L TOATIgTT

: . ot 00 L of e L ; i

plogy e i ey o g oy

3
i

LR ) S |
—oaOCa

R W B N 2
LS AW AR o e v A

fAET~ Y
L=

st~ ey
TIICTTCo— Wy

ot 0O 1 1
O — ot

PR oI o NE NP SRt |

AT SIS P Pyt ey Y iy S iy o g

L1y
FLroouoToTT

e

+ o
Ly ey

1523 i e

P PO E RN i oY

1

B S L SV v s gy ¥ 3.7

=

otz e

1
A= par mu e g

1o FEprp -
\_CALJ\.—M L g
N TR S P,

P NN |
LI e R i g i U

E WO W T

oMLY = mr= v~

Ao e o oy

ko
(TSR Sy g

TN E S N SN Sy N
LIS Al AT bbu\-"

£

IS

SN S IS SN B
[ P W [ SR T T Y e A g e W Ly ==y

1

.
2

CYS ENE N I Ny
e

Il
2

L i L v g







3459

30¢

289

23+5k

NR

g

—

3

&35

8435

Fard—§

are—martmuns—R-k0-—babts-eenprossed inkto—o-nominal

el O

EENE Y Pl oy e o
o ST T afit o

iineatp = iidn s

zz=a, o 3
Vot s —aE

Ead

A
sy
£
ik
4
o]
2
d
B
i
A
]
H
i)
Ee
]
8
m. s
i
il
b
+H
24
I
A
b}
]
r
o]
4
D
[
My
no4
-
b o}
AP
P
[
&8
o
jied
D
&£ -0
1 Eil)
-
]
]
i
4
£ -f
0
5@
oD
-
g
FICa. 3
T
]
¢
a3
o g
noQ
-
£ P
B
I
it
o

COmpT

4= NSNS
(=733 YO

- £

chayd
HECTITOTr—aT

FIOE—OF

i+

LIS = = = 23 5
=

A=l d
T CTEETHY

I

+ad

ERENETY
=TSt g tea—5r

S — e 5 s b 2 onan o
TSy TrEl

it

7

MG L] O o
T s

4
a =

AN P E e |
peErmteea
B oy

S =R

T |

W

w1 1960

PR i |

o

W f1ae

1)

Wo1—

ey

£ tho W
e ST Some Rt

OF
=1
oI

PO Ty S g
frt—the—anterior

+

EoW Tl

1
COV Ity IS8 -at3ofn

R.
A

o COYERRReRS

R
T

Pt

Eo T

oyl £vy £ +h Bacompmoanm i
T e O o TR e—oa e menss

\Triy

i

2]

TS T T 0T

EE NP |
T CaVETY
foly

Al d e e
oo IOt

it T T .
Ay

Wt

iiioes

ba-rmat
1~

Intens

ann =l O mended
AIS—~rd—eoht

i

U7 T

THOMES

EREY £ arg- £V %Y I
I— e T e 0ot

TRt CEL

=)
STt

+ ]

EREE TN |

EYiTea=rmEantas

depth
for

€t

13l 44

TS H IO T IO
i |

-
Ao
o e S—r

g—F Fod—aglak
SO T T e 05805

les P Y
Ta

1ok

=
et aa—eage

added—to—the—x
L

iy
1=

1.1

ol
oSttt

R—EL,

a3

Beh—
T OUGT

Ll

oo h P ES
T o551

11e%

Ly =n

Lo B P
= —ERety

£ EE NN
=23 E TR or

£l

31 1L ESACY oY
eI GEP TR 0T

ol
S

L v 3
z

PR VST P E VB ) ESR S
e CT O e S e ey

I£

+£hd e
SRCathhit

u=N
ShCTTrnyg

=)

7
FI
Hagtated

1ot o WEETY
P =

TSRO

Ranltl mowed b
Tt Cav ey

no
SHG

pii

E=4

p o hi% M BTN 4]

Ea)

=l e

s
E g E oy A F AL

E RN
=T

+ i
HERXE:

(253

+h

£
+

ooz e

5 =

TV

ot
T+

At ]
HE—east

£
T

Ehiner
T

menkted-—trd-th 3oyl abkad %
Wil RS ratea 5

J
SRR CReIYeett

EECITWOT PR, | chanathd w e Bt 1
[SLTasam s = ar A s T 5152 =4

STEGCEUI O

FoC VN Y |
CHTEEITOES

. ) : 4

= N

EREW T 3
[ELT AR N S xS v e R S

1 £ 4} 1

I
EFLE=ar

o tala s oy an +h o
wite—Iere—thid

Rezzaliia . Saseetd
vardeapPE1es

Aanrr]
EORT—%

o

Ml
LIT

=1
CIHe-

Faloon)
COH0y

PO N = TTIE 3 P 1)
LR Eig

TR O eFRGT oI

o3

Fodelaen. Tl

)

-
LU= F

ERPCCN Iy aLe ]
e ST 0T

EoE I B PO -
SEe—OFr

A

S
TeSEE

122 00 BV Y Wt S N |
i S e Wy [N R ¥ { A vy gAY w3

Vil

N
o

1 075
=

= PN S . W
p A ey L JF A W B Ry
P I AN R |

LT L= R Y 3~ g = I-.z O

ALl - = = U\JJ—I

(=B I ST
H

2017
Zo S

1.0
v

LJM_Y

201 . e Sty BTy
[TV Ay S N ingrs g e W et i

[
~r

1

[ PR SR ey W § nt.}.l— [ gl =y

k]

Ry=1 ~ o
.

Mty
TrowW

3 aOd gy o
Lo CcoOL Y




305-2-4-~- .09, Residential Building Codes. (NEW RULE) The
2015 International Residential Code (IRC} as modified below.

(1) IRC CHAPTER 3 BUILDING PLANNING.
(a) SECTION R302 FIRE~RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION.

1. R302.5.1 OPENING PROTECTION. Openings from a private
garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes shall not
be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence
shall be equipped with sclid wood doors not less than 1 3/8
inches (35mm) in thickness, solid or honeycomb core steel doors

not less than 1 3/8 inches (35mm) thick, or 20-minute fire-rated
doors.

(b) SECTION R313 AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS.

1. R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems.
Where installed, automatic residential fire sprinkler systems
shall be installed in accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D.

2. R313.2 ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AUTOMATIC FIRE

SYSTEMS. Where voluntarily installed, installations shall
comply with this section.

(c) SECTION R322 FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION.

1. R322.3.5.1 PROTECTION OF BUILDING ENVELOPE. Section
deleted.

(d) SECTION 324 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC ROOF SYSTEMS.

1. R324.7.2.2 HIP ROOF LAYOUTS. Panels and modules
installed on dwellings with hip roof layouts shall be located in
a manner that provides a clear access pathway not less than 3
feet (914 mm) in width from the eave to the ridge on each roof
slope where panels and modules are located. The access pathway
shall be located at a structurally strong location on the
building capable of supporting the live load of fire fighters
accessing the roof designed in accordance with Chapter 3.

(2) IRC CHAPTER 11 ENERGY EFFICIENCY.
(2) SECTION N1101 GENERAL.

1. N1101.3 (R101.5.1) Compliance materials. The Alabama
Residential and Energy Codes Board shall approve specific
computer software, worksheets, compliance manuals and other
similar materials that meet the intent of this code.



2. N1101.4 (R102.1.1) Above code programs. The Alabama
Building and Energy Codes Board shall deem a national, state or
local energy-efficiency program to exceed the energy efficiency
required by this code. Buildings approved in writing by such an
energy-efficiency program shall be considered in compliance with
this code. The requirements identified as "mandatory” in
Chapter 11 shall be met.

3. N1101.5 (R103.2) Information on construction docunents.
Construction documents shall be drawn to scale upon suitable
material. Electronic media documents are permitted to be
submitted when approved by the building official. Construction
documents shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the
location, nature and extent of the work proposed, and show in
sufficient detail pertinent data and features of the building,
systems and equipment as herein governed. Details shall
include, but are not limited to, as applicable:

1. Insulaticn materials and their R-values.

2. Fenestration U-factors and SHGCs where applicable,

3. Area-weighted U-factor and SHGC calculations.

4. Mechanical system design criteria.

5. Mechanical and service water heating system and
equipment types, sizes and efficiencies. '

6. Eguipment and system controls.

7. Duct sealing, duct and pipe insulation and location.

8. Alr sealing details.

4. N1101.6 (R202) DEFINED TERMS.

(i) Projection factor. The ratio of the horizontal depth
of an overhang, eave, or permanently attached shading device,
divided by the distance measured vertically from the bottom of
the fenestration glazing to the underside of the overhang, eave,
or permanently attached shading device.

(ii) Semi conditioned space. An unfinished area of the
dwelling such as the attic or crawl space that is insulated as
to limit or prevent air infiltration and maintain consistent

temperatures commensurate with those inside the thermal
envelope.

5. N1101.7.2 (R301.3) International climate zones. Section
deleted.

6. N11i01.8 (R301.4) Tropical climate zone. Section
deleted.



7. N1101.9 {(R302.1) Interior design conditions. The
interior design temperatures used for heating and cooling load
calculations shall be a maximum of 70°F (22° C) for heating and
minimum of 75°F (24° C) for cooling.

B. N1101.11.1 (R303.2.1) Protection of exposed insulation.
Section deleted

9. N1101.13.1 (R401.2.1) Tropical zone. Section deleted,
(b) SECTION N1102 (R402) BUILDING THERMAL ENVELOPE.

1. N1102.2.2 (R402.2.2) Ceilings without attic spaces.
Where Section R402.1.2 (N1102.1.2) would require insulation
levels above R-30 and the design of the roof/ceiling assembly
does not allow sufficient space for the required insulation, the
minimum required insulation for such roof/celling assemblies
shall be R-30. This reduction of insulation from the
requirements of Section R402.1.2 (N1102.1.2) shall be limited to
500 square feet (46 m?) or 20 percent of the total insulated
ceiling area, whichever is less. This reduction shall not apply
to the U-factor alternative approach in Section R402.1.4

(N1102.1.4) and the total UA alternative in Section R402.1.5
(N1102.1.5).

2. N1102.2.2.1 (R402.2.2.1) Semi-conditioned attics. Where
table N1102.1.1 (R402.1.1) requires R-30 or Table N1102.1.3
(R402.,1.3) requires a U-Factor of 0.035, Sprayed Polyurethane
Foam (SPF) with a U-Factor of 0.05 or R-value of R-20 shall be
deemed equivalent to the provisions in N1102.2.2 (R402.2.2) .

3. N1102.2.4 (R402.2.4) Access hatches and doors. Access
doors from conditioned spaces to unconditioned spaces (e.g.,
attics and crawl spaces) shall be weatherstripped and insulated
to a level in accordance with the following insulation values:

1. Hinged vertical doors shall have a maximum U-Factor of
U-0.20 (R-5 minimum)and comply with Section R-316

2. Hatches/scuttle hole covers shall have a maximum U-Factor
of U-0.05 (R-19 minimum) and;

3. Pull down stairs shall have a maximum U-Factor of U-0.20
with a minimum of 75 percent of the panel area having (R-
5 minimum) insulaticn.

Access shall be provided to all equipment that prevents damaging
or compressing the insulation. A wood framed or equivalent
baffle or retainer is required to be provided when loocse f£il1l
insulation is installed the purpose of which is to prevent the



loose fill insulation from spilling into the living space when
the attic access is opened, and to provide a permanent means of
maintaining the installed R-value of the loose fill insulation.

4. N1102.2.10 (R402.2.10) Slab on grade floors. Section
deleted.

5. N1102.2.11 (R402.2.11) Crawl space walls., As an
alternative to insulating floors over crawl spaces, crawl space
walls shall be permitted to be insulated when the crawl space 1is
not vented to the outside. The band joist shall be insulated
and alr sealed in accordance with Table N1102.4.1.1
(R402.4.1.1). A 3 inch (76mm) inspection/view strip shall be
provided immediately below the floor joists to permit
inspections for termites. Crawl space wall insulation shall be
permanently fastened to the wall and extend downward from the
bottom of the inspection/view strip to within 9 inches {22 9mm)
of the finished interior grade adjacent to the foundation wall,
Exposed earth in unvented crawl space foundations shall be
covered with a continuous Class I vapor retarder in accordance
with Section R408 of the International Residential Code. All
joints of the vapor retarder shall overlap by 6 inches (153 mm)
and shall extend up the stem wall not less than 6 inches (153mm)
and shall be attached to the stem wall.’ '

6. N1102.3.2.1 (R402.3.2.1) Glazed fenestration SHGC
exception. In Climate Zones 2 and 3, permanently shaded
vertical fenestration shall be permitted to satisfy the SHGC
requirements. The projection factor of an overhang, eave, or
permanently attached shading device shall be greater than or
equal to the value listed in table N1102.2.3.1 for the
appropriate orientation. The minimum projection shall extend
beyond each side of the glazing a minimum of 12 inches (0.3m) .
FEach orientation shall be rounded to the nearest cardinal
orientation (+/-45 degrees or 0.79 rad} for purposes of
calculations and demonstrating compliance.

7. N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1) Installation (Mandatory). The
components of the building thermal envelope as listed in Table
N1102.4.1.1 {Table R402.4.1.1) shall be installed in accordance
with the manufacturer’s instructions and the criteria listed in
Table N1102.4.1.1 (Table 402.4.1.1), as applicable to the method
of constructioen.

8. N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing (Mandatory). The
building or dwelling unit shall be tested and verified as having
an air leakage rate of not exceeding 5 air changes per hour.
Testing shall be conducted with a blower door at a pressure of
0.2 inches w.g. (50 Pascals). Testing shall be performed at any



time after creation of all penetrations of the building thermal
envelope. During testing:

1. Extericr windows and doors, fireplace and stove
docrs shall be closed, but not sealed, beyond the
intended weatherstripping or other infiltration
control measures;

2. Dampers including exhaust, intake, makeup air,
backdraft and flue dampers shall be closed, but not
sealed beyond intended infiltration control measures;

3. Interior doors, if installed at the time of the
test, shall be open;

4. Exteriocr doors for continuous ventilation systems
and heat recovery ventilators shall be closed and
sealed;

5. Heating and cocling systems, if installed at the
time of the test, shall be turned off; and

6. Supply and return registers, if installed at the
time of the test, shall be fully open.

(9) N1102.4.5 (R402.4.5) Recessed lighting. Recessed
luminaries installed in the building thermal envelope shall be
installed sealed tc limit air leakage between conditioned and
unconditioned spaces. All recessed luminaries shall be IC-rated
and labeled as having an air leakage rate not more than 2.0 cfm
(0.944 L/s) when tested in accordance with ASTM F 283 at a 1.57
psf (75 Pa) pressure differential. All recessed luminaires
shall be sealed with a gasket or caulk between the housing and
the interior wall or ceiling covering.

(c) SECTION N1103 (R403) SYSTEMS.

1. N1103.1.1 (R403.1.1) Programmable thermostat. Section
deleted.

2. N1103.9 (R403.9) Snow melt system controls. Section
deleted.

3. N1103.10 (R403.10) Residential pools and permanent
residential spas. Section deleted.

4. N1103.10.1 {(R403.10.1) Residential prools and permanent
residential spas. Section deleted.

5. N1103.10.2 (R403.10.2) Heaters. Section deleted.



6. N1103.10.3 (R403.10.3) Time Switches. Section deleted.

7. N1103.10.4 (R403.10.4) Covers. Section Deleted

8. N1103.11 (R403.11) Portable spas. Section deleted.

9. N1103.12 (R403.12) Residential pools and permanent
residential spas. Section deleted.

(d) SECTION N1104 (R404) ELECTRICAL POWER AND LIGHTING
SYSTEMS (MANDATORY) .

1. N1104.1 (R404.1) Lighting equipment (Mandatory). Not
less than 75 percent of the lamps in permanently installed
lighting fixtures at the time of inspection shall be high-
efficacy lamps or not less than 75 percent of the permanently

installed lighting fixtures shall contain only high efficacy
lamps.

(e) SECTION N1105 (R405) SIMULATED PERFORMANCE ALTERNATIVE
(PERFORMANCE) .

1. N1105.1 (R405.1) Scope. This section establishes
criteria for compliance using simulated energy performance
analysis. Such analysis shall include heating cooling and
service water heating energy only. The code official is not
responsible for verification of compliance for documents
submitted under this section.

2, N1105.3 (R405.3) Performance-based compliance.
Compliance based on simulated energy performance requires that a
proposed residence (proposed design) be shown to have an annual
energy cost that is less than or egqual to the annual energy cost
of the standard reference design. Energy prices shall be taken
from a source such as the Department of Energy, Energy
Information Administration’s State Energy Price and Expenditure
Report. Building officials—shall be permitted to require time-
or-use pricing in energy cost calculation.

(£f) SECTION N1106 (R406) ENERGY RATING INDEX COMPLIANCE
ALTERNATIVE .

1. N1106.1 (R406.1) Scope. This section establishes
criteria for compliance using an Energy Rating Index (ERI).
Such analysis shall include heating cooling and service water
heating energy only. The code official is not responsible for

verification of compliance for documents submitted under this
section.



2. N1106.4 (R406.4) ERI-based compliance. Compliance based
on an ERI analysis requires that the rated design be shown to
have an ERI less than or equal to a score of 70 in both zones 2
and 3 when compared to the ERI reference design.

3. Table N1106.4 (Table R406.4) Maximum Energy Rating
Index. Table Deleted.

(3) IRC CHAPTER 24 FUEL GAS
(a) SECTION G24122 (401) GENERAL,

1. G2412.9 (401.9) Identification. Each length of pipe and
tubing utilized in a fuel gas system shall bear the
identification of the manufacturer. If not provided on the
packaging or crating or by other approved documentation, each
pipe fitting, utilized in a piping system shall bear the
identification of the manufacturer.

(4) IRC CHAPTER 34 ELECTRICAL GENERAL REQUIREMENTS
(a) SECTION E3401 GENERAL.

1. R3401.1 Applicability. The provisions of Chapters 34
through 43 shall establish the general scope of the electrical
system and equipment reguirements of this code. Chapters 34
through 43 cover those wiring methods and materials most
commonly encountered in the construction of one- and two-family
dwellings and structures regulated by this code. Other wiring
methods, materials, and subject matter covered in NFPA 70-2008
or in compliance with the 2008 Naticnal Electric Code, or
subsequent editions of such codes shall be allowed by this ccde
and deemed equivalent with the code adopted by this board.

(5) EFFECTIVE DATE. For purposes of enforcement, this code
shall become effective on October 1, 2016.

Author: Karen Clifton; Bret Warren, Heather Goggin

Statutory Authority: Code of Ala. 1975, §§41-23-80 through 85,
as amended '

History: New Rule: filed April 5, 2012; Effective May 10, 2012.
Amended: January 16, 2014; Effective: March 18, 2014

Repealed:

New Rule: Filed




APPENDIX A

TABLE N1102.1.1.1 (R402.1.1)
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY

COMPONENT 2

o
FENES- 8KY- erazep | .| VOO mass | Lo | masemmNme stn s‘;ﬁ‘;ﬂ
CLIMATE | TRATION | LIGHT | FENEST- ERAME | vrL WALL,
ZONE U- U- RATTION WEJE W‘:E'I' R- VJ;RL—U'E R~ VM&‘UE WRM‘L
b b B, o ] -
FACTOR® | FACTOR® | sHGC vavys | VAU VALUE L [
1 1.2 0.75 0.30 30 13 3/4 13 0 0 0
2 0.651 0.75 0.30 30 13 4/6 13 0 0 0
3 0.50 0.65 0.30 30 13 5/8 19 5/13¢ 0 5/13
4 13 5/10 10
except 0.35 0.60 NR 38 19 10/13 2f£ 10/13
Marine
5 and
. 20 or 16, 10/13
wazine 0.35 C.60 NR 38 e | 13717 309 10/13 Seh
20 or 10, 10/13
6 0.35 C.60 NR 49 aer | 15719 309 15/19 o
7 and 8 0.35 0.60 NR 43 21 19/21 389 15/19 }lgé 10/13
For SI: 1 foot 304.8 mmn,

k. R-values are minimums.

2 x & framing cavity such that the R-value is reduced by R-1 or more shall be marked with the
compressed batt R-value in addition to the full thickness R-value.

1. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed
fenestration.

U-facteors and SHGC are maximums.

R~19 batts compressed into a nominal

m, ™“15/19" means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or

"15/19" shall be permitted to
be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R-5 continuous

R-19 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

insulated sheathing on the interior or extericr of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous

insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the
interior of the basement wall.

n. R-5 shall be added te the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs. Insulation depth

shall be the depth of the footing or 2 feet, whichever is less in Zones 1 through 3 for

heated slabs.
©. There are no SHGC reguirements in the Marine Zone.

P- Basement wall insulation is not required in warm-humid locations as defined by Figure 301.1
and Table 301.1.

g. Or insulation sufficlent to fill the framing cavity, R-19 minimum.

r. “1i345” means R-13 cavity insulation plus R-5 insulated sheathing. If structural sheathing

covers 25 percent or less of the exterior, insulating sheathing is not required where

structural sheathing is used. If structural sheathing covers more than 25 percent of the

exterior, structural sheathing shall be supplemented with insulated sheathing of at least R-

2,

$. The second R-value applies when more than half the insulation is on the interior of the mass
wall,

t. For impact rated fenestration complying with Section R301.2.1.2 of the International
Residential Code or Sectien 1608.1.2 of the International Building Code, the maximum U-factor

shall be 0.75 in Zonas 2 and 0.65 in Zone 3,




TABLE N1102.1.4
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS®

Ceili Frame Mass F1 B & Crawl
Climate | Fenestration | 8kylight 812409 | wal1 Wall oo asemnen Space
u- u- Wall U-
Zone U~-Factor U-Factor Fact U= U- Factor Factor Wall U-
actox Faator | Factor® | "o ae Factor
2 0.65 0.75 0.035 (0.084(0.165 [0.064|0.360 0.477
3 0.50 0.65 0.035 [0.084(0.141 |0.047|0.360 0.135

&. Non-fenestration U-factors shall be obtained from measurement,

calculation, or an approved socurce.
b. When more than half the insulation is on the interior, the mass wall u-
factors shall be a maximum of 0.14 in Zone 2 and 0.12 in Zone 3.

TABLE N1102.2.2.1
MINIMUM PROJECTION FACTOR REQUIRED BY ORIENTATION FOR SHGC EXCEPTION

Orientation Projection Factor
North >=0.40a
South >=0.20
Fast >=0,50
West >=0,50

a. For the north orientation, a vertical projection located on the
west edge of the fenestration with eguivalent PF>=0.15 shall also
satisfy the minimum projection factor requirement.



TABLE C402.5.2
MAXIMUM AIR LEAKAGE RATE
FOR FENESTRATION ASSEMBLIES

FENESTRATION ASSEMBLY m;“é‘fé‘;’;ﬂf’};ﬂ _ TESTPROCEDURE
Windows 020"

| Sliding doors - 0.20° AAMA/WDMA/
Swinging doors 020 CSA101/1.8.2/A440
Skylights — with conden- or
sgozf weepage openings 0.30 NFRC 400
Skylights — all other 0.20°
Curtain walls 0.06 |
Storefront glazing 0.06 NFR;‘J‘GO
Commercial glazed 1.00  |ASTME283at1.57psf
swinging entrance doors (75 Pa)
Revolving doors 1.00
Garage doors 1040 | ANSUDASMA 105,
Rolling doors T 1.00 | NFRCA00, or
— e ASTME 283 at 1.57 psf
High-speed doors 1.30 (75 Pa)

For SI: 1 cubic foot per minute = 0.47L/s, 1 square foot = 0.093 m?,

a. The maximum rate for windows, sliding and swinging doors, and skylights is
permitted to be 0.3 cfin per square foot of fenestration or door ares when tested
in accordance with AAMA/WDMA/CSA101/1.8.2/A440 at 6.24 psf (300 Pa).



TABLE N1105.5.5(1)

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE STANDARD REFERENCE AND PROPOSED DESIGNS
BUILDING PROPCSED
COMPONENT STANDARD REFERENCE DESIGN DESTGN

Total areaP =15% of the conditioned floor area As proposed
Orientation: equally distributed to four cardinal | As proposed
compass orientations (N, E, 8, & W)
U~factor: from Table 402.1.3 As proposed
Glazing® SHGC: From Table 402.1.1 except that for climates | As proposed
with no reguirement (NR)SHGC = 0.40 shall be
used.
Intericr shade fraction: 0.92-{0.21 x SHGC for As proposad
the standard reference design}
External shading: none As proposed
Fuel type: same as proposed design As- proposed
Efficiences:
Electric: air-source heat pump with prevailing As proposed
federal minimum standards
Heating Nonelectric furnaces: natural gas furnace with As proposed
systemsh prevailing federal minimum standards
Nonelectric boilers: natural gas boiler with As proposed
prevailing federal minimum standards
Capacity: sized in accordance with Secticn As proposed
N1103.6
Fuel Type: Electric As proposed
Cooli Efficiency: In accordance with prevailing federal | As proposed
eoiing - minimum standards
systemsb: 3
Capacity: sized in accordance with Section As proposed
N1103.6
Fuel type: same as proposed design As proposed
Efficiency: In accordance with prevailing federal | As proposed
Service minimum standards
Water
Heatingh ¥ i [ Use: gal/day = 30 10 x Nbr Same as
standard
Tank temperature: 120° F reference

Author: Karen Clifton; Bret Warren, Heather Goggin

Statutory Authority:
New Rule: filed April 5,

 History:

Code of Ala.

1975, §841-23-80 through 85, amended
2012; Effective May 1G, 2012.

Amended: January 16, 2014; Effective: March 18, 2014; Repealed:; New

Rule: Filed




